
City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 11, 2008
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 24-4-12, 
60% Nutralene, Fairway Grade         
(50 lbs/bag)

150 Bags  180 Bags 
$29.99 5,398.20$       No Bid -$                21.92$            3,288.00$       No Bid -$                21.50$            3,225.00$       

2 22-0-22, 100% Nutralene, Fairway 
Grade (50 lbs/bag) 100 Bags  116 Bags 

$22.43 2,601.88$       No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                23.90$            2,390.00$       

3
Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 20-0-20 
100% Nutralene, Greens Grade         
(50 lbs/bag)

60 Bags No Bid -$                No Bid -$                24.57$            1,474.20$       No Bid -$                35.35$            2,121.00$       

4 25-3-3 with Trimec (50 lbs/bag) 15 Bags 21 Bags       
$18.65 391.65$          No Bid -$                17.52$            262.80$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

5 18-2-3 with TEAM (1.155%) 3.2 WIN 
(50 lbs/bag) 35 Bags 44 Bags       

$16.99 
747.56$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

6 Fertilizer: 18-5-9, Guaranteed Analysis
(50 lbs/bag) 750 Bags  563 Bags 

$20.45 11,513.35$     22.50$            16,875.00$     12.29$            9,217.50$       No Bid -$                21.60$            16,200.00$     

7 Fertilizer: 18-24-12, Country Club 
Starter (50 lbs/bag) 95 Bags 21.95$            2,085.25$       No Bid -$                15.39$            1,462.05$       No Bid -$                16.55$            1,572.25$       

8 Wetting Agents: Pipeline 150 Gal 35.00$            5,250.00$       36.00$            5,400.00$       30.50$            4,575.00$       No Bid -$                36.00$            5,400.00$       

9
Fungicides: Aliette Signature WDG 
(Ethyl Hydrogen Phophonate, 
Fosetylal (2-11 lb bags/case)

1 Case 631.80$          631.80$          400.00$          400.00$          396.00$          396.00$          517.00$          517.00$          450.00$          450.00$          

10 Daconil (Chlorothalonil 54%) 
Flowable (2-2.5 Gal/Case) 37 Cases 154.40$          5,712.80$       190.00$          7,030.00$       146.00$          5,402.00$       156.75$          5,799.75$       203.00$          7,511.00$       

11 Banol (Propamacarb) (2-1 Gal/Case) 10 Cases 832.32$          8,323.20$       740.00$          7,400.00$       574.00$          5,740.00$       805.00$          8,050.00$       650.00$          6,500.00$       

12 Emerald (3 X .49 lbs./bag) 3 Cases 404.25$          1,212.75$       1,323.00$       3,969.00$       1,347.50$       4,042.50$       1,347.50$       4,042.50$       404.25$          1,212.75$       

13
3336 Cleary's Flowable (Thiophanate-
Methyl 46.2%)             (2 x 2.5 
Gal/Case)

20 Cases 490.00$          9,800.00$       655.00$          13,100.00$     445.00$          8,900.00$       472.50$          9,450.00$       560.00$          11,200.00$     

14 Chipco 26GT Flowable 23.3% 
(Iprodione) (4-1 Gal/Case) 30 Cases 24 Cases      

$ 311.74 7,481.76$       375.00$          11,250.00$     250.00$          7,500.00$       384.25$          11,527.50$     504.00$          15,120.00$     

15 Banner Maxx (Propiconazole)   (2X1 
Gal/Case) 15 Cases 307.50$          4,612.50$       625.00$          9,375.00$       270.00$          4,050.00$       690.00$          4,140.00$       615.00$          9,225.00$       

16 Heritage (6 lbs/case) 1 Case 3 Pints        
$270.00 /each 810.00$          2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       2,100.00$       

17
Pre & Post Emergent Weed Control: 
Betasan 12.5G (Bensulide)             (50 
lbs/bag)

15 Bags No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                76.50$            1,147.50$       

18 Trimec Classic (2,4-D+NCPP 
+Dicamba) (2 X 2.5 Gals/Case) 3 Cases 110.00$          330.00$          No Bid -$                130.00$          390.00$          105.00$          315.00$          142.00$          426.00$          

19 Round-up Pro (2 - 2.5 Gal/Case) 60 Gal 34.00$            2,040.00$       No Bid -$                24.00$            1,440.00$       32.00$            1,920.00$       44.00$            2,640.00$       

Green Velvet Sod Farms
3620 Upper Bellbrook Rd.

Bellbrook, OH 45305
(937) 848-2501

Helena Chemical Co.
336 Cottage Grove Circle

Pataskala, OH 43062
(614) 604-2854

Lesco, Inc.
1301 East 9th Street

Cleveland, OH 44114-1849
(800) 321-5325

Kenny Corporation
8420 Zionsville Road

(317) 872-4793
Indianapolis, IN 46268

Turfgrass, Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.
Florence, KY 41042

(859) 594-4948
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 11, 2008
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total
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20 Kog Weed Control (35.5 lbs/bag) 5 Bags No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                41.25$            206.25$          
21 Oryzalin 4 Pro (2 - 2.5 Gal/Case) 45 Gal 61.00$            2,745.00$       No Bid -$                51.00$            2,295.00$       75.75$            3,408.75$       63.00$            2,835.00$       
22 Insecticides: Simitar 20 Qts. 137.73$          2,754.60$       135.00$          2,700.00$       106.00$          2,120.00$       130.00$          2,600.00$       115.00$          2,300.00$       

23 Merit (Imidacloprid) 2-2.5 Gal/Case 50 Gal  21 Cases 
$795.00 / case 16,695.00$     No Bid -$                295.00$          14,750.00$     425.00$          21,250.00$     518.00$          25,900.00$     

24 Preen 3,000 lbs 0.65$              1,950.00$       No Bid -$                0.46$              1,380.00$       No Bid -$                1.68$              5,040.00$       
25 Manage (10 X 1.3 Oz Bottle/Case) 2 Cases 995.86$          1,991.72$       900.00$          1,800.00$       715.00$          1,430.00$       890.00$          1,780.00$       830.00$          1,660.00$       

26 Urban Ectasy 80/15/5 
Fescue/Rye/Blue 2000 lbs 1.12$              2,240.00$       No Bid -$                No Bid -$                1.30$              2,600.00$       1.22$              2,440.00$       

27 Grass Seed: KY 31 1000 lbs 1.22$              1,220.00$       No Bid -$                No Bid -$                1.26$              1,260.00$       1.27$              1,270.00$       
28 Snapshot 2.5 TG 10 Bags 97.79$            977.90$          100.00$          1,000.00$       79.00$            790.00$          82.50$            825.00$          84.00$            840.00$          

29 Athletic Field and Playground Seed 
Mixture (50 lbs/bag) 2450 lbs 1.48$              3,626.00$       No Bid -$                No Bid -$                1.37$              3,356.50$       1.22$              2,989.00$       

30 Recede Liquid Antifoam               (12 
X 16 Oz. Bottles/CS) 3 Cases 95.65$            286.95$          No Bid -$                54.00$            162.00$          114.00$          342.00$          50.00$            150.00$          

31 Lake Pond Colorant                         
4/1 Gallons Per Case 2 Cases 105.00$          210.00$          125.00$          250.00$          74.00$            148.00$          104.00$          208.00$          140.00$          280.00$          

32 Copper Sulphate Crystals             (50 
lbs/bag) 2 Bags 7 pails        

$38.00 / each 266.00$          100.00$          200.00$          No Bid -$                No Bid -$                110.00$          220.00$          

33 Barricade 65 WG                        (5/10 
lb bags / per case) 1 Case 1,070.00$       1,070.00$       1,800.00$       1,800.00$       880.00$          880.00$          1,197.50$       1,197.50$       1,450.00$       1,450.00$       

34 Quick Silver (Carfentrazone-Ethyl) 8 
OZ /Bottle 5 Bottles 95.30$            476.50$          125.00$          625.00$          98.00$            490.00$          125.00$          625.00$          118.00$          590.00$          

Total 105,452.37$    85,274.00$     84,685.05$     87,314.50$     136,610.75$    

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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