
City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened March 2, 2009
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 24-0-22, 
Meth Ex Fairway Grade                  
(50 lbs/bag)

365 Bags  $            36.85 13,687.50$     No Bid 40.00$            14,600.00$     28.00$            10,220.00$     

2 25-5-12, 96% SCU Fairway Grade (50 
lbs/bag) 79 Bags  $            37.85 2,990.15$       No Bid 34.00$            2,686.00$       25.25$            1,994.75$       

3 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 9-18-18 (50 
lbs/bag) 21 Bags  $            52.20 1,096.20$       No Bid 48.60$            1,020.60$       No Bid

4 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 18-9-18, 
Contec (50 lbs/bag) 25 Bags 51.90$            1,297.50$       No Bid 51.90$            1,297.50$       26.50$            662.50$          

5 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 21-3-16, 
Nutralene (50 lbs/bag) 13 Bags 41.00$            533.00$          No Bid 44.00$            572.00$          28.50$            370.50$          

6
Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 13-2-13, 
W/AMM. Sulfate, 2% FE, Micros (50 
lbs/bag)

21 Bags 28.85$            605.85$          No Bid 31.00$            651.00$          22.00$            462.00$          

7 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 0-0-22-11, 
K-MAG (50 lbs/bag) 27 Bags 16.95$            457.65$          22.50$            607.50$          21.25$            573.75$          18.00$            486.00$          

8 Fertilizer - Tee Grade: 5-5-25, 
W/Dimension (50 lbs/bag) 15 Bags 32.50$            487.50$          No Bid 31.50$            472.50$          29.00$            435.00$          

9 Fertilizer - Tee Grade: 15-0-29, 96% 
SCU of Poly S (50 lbs/bag) 58 Bags 39.65$            2,299.70$       No Bid 36.00$            2,088.00$       28.00$            1,624.00$       

10
Fertilizer -Rough Grade 25-5-12, 50% 
SCU or 30-0-10 XRT               (50 
lbs/bag)

180 Bags 27.70$            4,986.00$       No Bid 22.50$            4,050.00$       15.85$            2,844.00$       

11 Fertilizer - Fairway Grade 14-0-14, 
w/dimension  (50 lbs/bag) 65 Bags 28.85$            1,875.25$       No Bid 27.50$            1,787.50$       32.50$            2,112.50$       

12 Emerald (3 X .49 lbs./bag) 2 Cases 137.20$          823.20$          411.60$          823.20$          411.60$          823.20$          1,372.00$       2,744.00$       

13 Cleary's 26/36 Flowable                     
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases 750.00$          2,250.00$       750.00$          2,250.00$       750.00$          2,250.00$       750.00$          2,250.00$       

14 Chipco 26GT Flowable 23.3% 
(Iprodione) (2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases  $          625.00 1,250.00$       620.00$          1,240.00$       560.00$          1,120.00$       269.00$          538.00$          

15 Triplet - (2,4-D, Mecroprop, Dicamba) 
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases  $          117.50 470.00$          No Bid 115.00$          460.00$          110.00$          440.00$          

16 Round-Up Pro                                (2 
x 2.5 Gal/Case) 8 Cases  $          150.00 1,200.00$       No Bid 165.00$          1,320.00$       200.00$          1,600.00$       

Harrell's
720 Kraft Rd.

(863) 687-2774
Lankland, FL  33802

Green Velvet Sod Farms
3620 Upper Bellbrook Road

Bellbrook, OH  45305
(937-603-8414

Turfgrass, Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.

Florence, KY  41042
(859) 594-4948

Lesco, Inc.
1301 East 9th Street #1300

Cleveland, OH  44114
(800) 321-5325
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17 Snapshot 2.5 TG (50 lbs/bag) 105 Bags 83.50$            8,767.50$       94.00$            9,870.00$       88.00$            9,240.00$       95.00$            9,975.00$       

18 Athletic Field and Playground Seed 
Mixture (50 lbs/bag) 2000 lbs 1.24$              2,480.00$       No Bid 1.15$              2,300.00$       1.15$              2,300.00$       

19 Recede Liquid Antifoam               (12 
X 16 Oz. Bottles/CS) 2 Cases No Bid No Bid 56.00$            112.00$          65.00$            130.00$          

20 Protek-Phosphoric Acid (Phosphites) 1000 lbs  No Bid No Bid 3.00$              3,000.00$       No Bid

21
Quick Water                               
Tricure Wetting Agent                     (2 
X 2.5 gal/case)

4 Cases $43.00/gal. 860.00$          400.00$          1,600.00$       235.00$          940.00$          220.00$          880.00$          

22 14-2-14, Foliar Fertilizer                   
(30 Gal Drum) 1 Drum  No Bid No Bid $43.00/case 258.00$          No Bid

23
Sync-Carbohydrate, Amine                
Non-Ionic Surfactant                          
(12 Pints/Case)

2 Cases  No Bid No Bid 185.00$          370.00$          100.00$          200.00$          

24 Iprodione (26019)                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 6 Cases $68.00/gal. 2,040.00$       295.00$          1,770.00$       325.00$          1,950.00$       269.00$          1,614.00$       

25 Chlorothalonil (ex. Mainsail)              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 6 Cases 39.25$            1,177.50$       250.00$          1,500.00$       225.00$          1,350.00$       192.00$          1,152.00$       

26 Daconil - WS                                      
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 9 Cases 386.25$          3,476.25$       386.75$          3,480.75$       386.26$          3,476.34$       386.25$          3,476.25$       

27 Primo Max                                         
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 1 Gal 350.00$          350.00$          435.00$          435.00$          440.00$          440.00$          398.00$          398.00$          

28 Proxy                                                   
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases 42.00$            630.00$          210.00$          630.00$          192.00$          576.00$          232.00$          696.00$          

29 Instrata                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases $158.72/gal. 3,968.00$       793.60$          3,968.00$       793.60$          3,968.00$       793.60$          3,968.00$       

30 Bensumec 4 LF                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases 550.00$          1,100.00$       410.00$          820.00$          415.00$          830.00$          510.00$          1,020.00$       

31 Concert                                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 18 Cases $99.75/gal. 8,977.50$       498.75$          8,977.50$       498.76$          8,977.68$       498.76$          8,977.68$       

32 Curalan                                               
(12 X 2.75 Lbs/Case) 2 Cases $34.00/lb. 2,244.00$       1,122.00$       2,244.00$       1,122.00$       2,244.00$       1,122.00$       2,244.00$       

33 Legacy                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases 1,904.00$       3,808.00$       1,900.00$       3,800.00$       $950.00/2.5 gal 3,800.00$       1,904.00$       3,808.00$       

34 Cutless                                               
(60 X 8 oz Drum) 2 Drums 3,507.00$       7,014.00$       No Bid 3,507.00$       7,014.00$       3,507.00$       7,014.00$       

35 Sevin                                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases 39.80$            796.00$          190.00$          760.00$          143.00$          572.00$          190.00$          760.00$          
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36
PK Plus                                              
3-7-18+Micros & 14% Phosphite     (2 
X 2.5 gal/Case)

4 Cases  No Bid No Bid 238.00$          952.00$          300.00$          1,200.00$       

37 Bifenthrin 7.9% SC                            
(4 X 1 Gal/Case) 1.5 Cases $45.00/gal. 270.00$          No Bid 140.00$          210.00$          $115.00/gal. 690.00$          

38 4-0-0, Fluid Mn/Mg                          
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases 215.00$          430.00$          No Bid 185.00$          370.00$          39.00$            78.00$            

39
Ferromec Ac                                      
15-0-0, 6% Fe                                 (2 
X 2.5 Gal/Case)

12 Cases 9.95$              597.00$          No Bid 48.00$            576.00$          33.25$            399.00$          

40 Gary's Green Ultra                            
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 8 Cases  No Bid No Bid 165.00$          1,320.00$       110.00$          880.00$          

41 Headway                                             
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 2.5 Cases 1,075.00$       2,687.50$       1,100.00$       2,750.00$       1,100.00$       2,750.00$       $628.00/gal. 3,140.00$       

42 Meridian 25 Wg                                 
(4 X 17 oz/Case) 8 Cases 426.36$          3,410.88$       426.36$          3,410.88$       426.36$          3,410.88$       426.36$          3,410.88$       

43 Tourney                                             
(4 X 5 lbs/Case) 12 lbs 176.57/lb. 2,648.55$       No Bid $882.85/ea. 2,648.55$       153.77$          1,845.26$       

44 Chipco Signature                               
(4 X 5.5 lbs/Case) 3 Cases 549.00$          1,647.00$       No Bid 475.00$          1,425.00$       484.99$          1,454.97$       

45
Sili-Kal B                                            
8-0-4                                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)

2 Cases  No Bid No Bid 207.50$          415.00$          No Bid

46 Surflan As                                          
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases 69.00$            1,035.00$       No Bid 260.00$          780.00$          $225.00/case-4 900.00$          

47
Fertilizer                                            
w/Pre-M Dimension 18-3-8              
(50 lbs/Bag)

50 Bags 16.50$            857.50$          No Bid 26.00$            1,300.00$       16.50$            825.00$          

48 Clean Up Pro (Lesco)                        
(10 Gal/Case) 2 Cases  No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00$          800.00$          

Total 97,581.68$     50,936.83$     103,347.50$    93,019.29$     

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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