
City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 17-0-17, 
100 % Meth Urea                               
(50 lbs/bag)

142 Bags  $            29.91 4,247.22$       29.00$            4,118.00$       28.00$            3,080.00$       20.31$            2,884.02$       

2
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 20-0-10, 
60% Meth Urea                                  
(50 lbs/bag) 

144 Bags  $            30.43 4,381.92$       25.75$            3,708.00$       23.50$            2,820.00$       22.26$            3,205.44$       

3
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:12-4-8, 25-
50% Slow Release                          
(50 lbs/bag)

20 Bags  No Bid -$                16.00$            320.00$          26.75$            535.00$          No Bid -$                

4
Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 14-25-12, 
25-50 Slow Release                           
(50 lbs/bag)

21 Bags 30.23$            634.83$          38.00$            798.00$          30.00$            630.00$          20.54$            431.34$          

5 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 0-22-11, 
w/.25Mg  (50 lbs/bag) 50 Bags 27.52$            1,376.00$       18.50$            925.00$          18.00$            900.00$          11.65$            582.50$          

6 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 15-2-15, 
61% WIN w/Micros (50 lbs/bag) 66 Bags 30.21$            1,993.86$       47.00$            3,102.00$       44.40$            3,063.60$       43.00$            2,838.00$       

7 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 10-4-16, 
90% Ammonium Sulfate (50 lbs/bag) 30 Bags 26.08$            782.40$          27.00$            810.00$          25.50$            586.50$          16.41$            492.30$          

8 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 18-4-5, 50% 
Nutralene (50 lbs/bag) 19 Bags 30.88$            586.72$          26.00$            494.00$          44.40$            1,021.20$       No Bid -$                

9 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 21-4-11,  
95% Nutralene 1% Fe (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags 34.03$            612.54$          27.00$            486.00$          44.60$            1,215.00$       44.50$            801.00$          

10 Fertilizer -Tee Grade 14-25-10,    25% 
XRT  (50 lbs/bag) 15 Bags No Bid -$                17.00$            255.00$          30.50$            457.50$          20.54$            308.10$          

11 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 5-5-15, 
w/Dimension .125 (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags 29.88$            537.84$          26.50$            477.00$          26.00$            468.00$          21.21$            381.78$          

12 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 14-0-14,        
90% SCU Micros (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags 29.73$            535.14$          29.00$            522.00$          28.00$            420.00$          19.81$            356.58$          

13 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 20-0-10,        
60% Meth Urea/UF (50 lbs/bag) 19 Bags 29.84$            566.96$          25.75$            489.25$          24.00$            336.00$          22.26$            422.94$          

14 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 33-3-6,        
50% XRT (50 lbs/bag) 12 Bags 17.36$            208.32$          16.50$            198.00$          24.00$            408.00$          15.20$            182.40$          

15 Fertilizer - Roough Grade 14-0-14,       
w/ Dinmension .160 (50 lbs/bag) 65 Bags 16.42$            1,067.30$       32.00$            2,080.00$       18.50$            1,202.50$       15.70$            1,020.50$       

John Deere Landscapes
1301 East 9th Street

Cleveland, OH 44114
(800) 321-5325

Turfgrass, Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.

Florence, KY  41042
(859) 594-4948

Green Velvet
3620 Upper Bellbrook Rd.

Bellbrook, OH 45305
(937) 848-2501

The Hill Co.
2776 Circle Port Drive

(859) 815-8320
Erlanger, KY 41018
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

John Deere Landscapes
1301 East 9th Street

Cleveland, OH 44114
(800) 321-5325

Turfgrass, Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.

Florence, KY  41042
(859) 594-4948

Green Velvet
3620 Upper Bellbrook Rd.

Bellbrook, OH 45305
(937) 848-2501

The Hill Co.
2776 Circle Port Drive

(859) 815-8320
Erlanger, KY 41018

16 Fertilizer - Roough Grade 25-5-12,       
50% SCU (50 lbs/bag) 180 Bags 13.89$            2,500.20$       19.00$            3,420.00$       29.00$            5,220.00$       14.00$            2,520.00$       

17 Triplet - (2,4-D, Mecroprop, Dicamba) 
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases 108.64$          434.56$          120.00$          480.00$          103.00$          412.00$          122.00$          488.00$          

18 Round-Up Pro                                (2 
x 2.5 Gal/Case) 8 Cases 77.10$            616.80$          280.00$          2,240.00$       75.00$            600.00$          70.34$            562.72$          

19 Athletic Field  Seed Mixture 78% Tall 
Fescue, Ryes, Blue (50 lbs/bag) 1500 lbs 0.86$              1,290.00$       0.84$              1,260.00$       1.02$              1,530.00$       0.78$              1,170.00$       

20 Chlorothalonil (ex. Mainsail)              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 10 Cases 172.50$          1,725.00$       220.00$          2,200.00$       173.00$          1,730.00$       181.00$          1,810.00$       

21 Daconil - WS                                      
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 20 Cases 282.50$          5,650.00$       282.50$          5,650.00$       282.50$          5,650.00$       282.50$          5,650.00$       

22 Primo Max                                         
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 1 Case 550.00$          550.00$          550.00$          550.00$          550.00$          550.00$          392.00$          392.00$          

23 Proxy                                                   
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases 152.50$          305.00$          205.00$          410.00$          189.00$          378.00$          239.42$          478.84$          

24 Instrata                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases 769.00$          2,307.00$       769.00$          2,307.00$       769.00$          2,307.00$       769.00$          2,307.00$       

25 Bensumec 4 LF                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases No Bid -$                440.00$          880.00$          365.00$          730.00$          528.88$          1,057.76$       

26 Concert                                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 21 Cases 390.00$          8,190.00$       390.00$          8,190.00$       390.00$          8,190.00$       390.00$          8,190.00$       

27 Curalan                                               
(12 X 2.75 Lbs/Case) 4 Cases 1,138.50$       4,554.00$       1,138.50$       4,554.00$       1,138.50$       4,554.00$       1,138.50$       4,554.00$       

28 Legacy                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2.5 Gal 978.50$          2,446.25$       978.50$          978.50$          950.00$          2,375.00$       1,957.00$       4,892.50$       

29 Bifenthrin 7.9% SC                               
(4 X 1 Gal/Case) 2 Cases 145.00$          290.00$          140.00$          280.00$          122.00$          244.00$          150.00$          300.00$          

30 Ferromec AC 15-0-0,6% FE                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 20 Cases 44.40$            888.00$          49.00$            980.00$          43.00$            860.00$          36.50$            730.00$          

31 Headway                                          
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 11 Cases 810.00$          8,910.00$       810.00$          8,910.00$       810.00$          8,910.00$       810.00$          8,910.00$       

32 Meridian 25WG                                     
(4 X 17 oz/Case) 8 Cases 408.00$          3,264.00$       408.00$          3,166.00$       408.00$          3,166.00$       408.00$          3,264.00$       

33 Chipco Signature                                   
(4 X 5.5 lbs./Case) 4 Cases No Bid -$                491.00$          1,964.00$       515.00$          2,060.00$       549.60$          2,198.40$       

34 Propaconizole                                        
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases 575.00$          1,725.00$       494.50$          1,483.50$       525.00$          1,575.00$       475.00$          1,425.00$       

35 Scimitar                                               
(1Qt Bottle) 9 Quarts No Bid -$                132.00$          1,188.00$       124.00$          1,116.00$       157.88$          1,420.92$       
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

John Deere Landscapes
1301 East 9th Street

Cleveland, OH 44114
(800) 321-5325

Turfgrass, Inc.
8045 D Dixie Hwy.

Florence, KY  41042
(859) 594-4948

Green Velvet
3620 Upper Bellbrook Rd.

Bellbrook, OH 45305
(937) 848-2501

The Hill Co.
2776 Circle Port Drive

(859) 815-8320
Erlanger, KY 41018

36 Clearys 3336 plus                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 7 Cases 424.10$          2,968.70$       460.00$          3,220.00$       230.00$          3,220.00$       420.00$          2,940.00$       

37 Chipco 26019                                         
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 11 Cases 271.15$          2,982.65$       280.00$          3,080.00$       243.00$          2,673.00$       259.00$          2,849.00$       

38 Stressphiter                                            
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 21 Cases 202.00$          4,242.00$       155.00$          3,255.00$       140.00$          2,940.00$       122.00$          2,562.00$       

39 Quicksilver                                            
(8 oz bottles) 7 Bottles No Bid -$                115.00$          805.00$          105.00$          735.00$          118.00$          826.00$          

40 Sticker                                              
(4 X 1 Gal/Case) 1 Gal 19.73$            19.73$            25.00$            25.00$            35.00$            35.00$            32.00$            32.00$            

41 Manganese                                             
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases 188.00$          752.00$          110.00$          440.00$          141.50$          566.00$          41.00$            164.00$          

42 Echo Ultimate 150 lbs 5.50$              825.00$          6.00$              900.00$          6.00$              900.00$          6.61$              991.50$          

43 Emerald                                              
(3 x .49 lbs/bag) 1 Case 142.10$          426.30$          426.30$          426.30$          1,421.00$       1,421.00$       411.60$          411.60$          

44 True Foliar P 6-12-6                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 1 Case No Bid -$                190.00$          190.00$          136.00$          136.00$          No Bid -$                

45 True Foliar N 19-1-6                             
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases No Bid -$                185.00$          740.00$          132.00$          528.00$          60.58$            242.32$          

46 True Foliar Ca                                        
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 1 Case No Bid -$                235.00$          235.00$          195.00$          195.00$          40.28$            40.28$            

47 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal No Bid -$                38.00$            304.00$          38.00$            304.00$          20.72$            165.76$          
48 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal No Bid -$                56.00$            896.00$          52.00$            832.00$          34.50$            552.00$          

Total 75,393.24$     84,503.05$     83,785.30$     75,828.10$     

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of 
 Quantity Measure

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 17-0-17, 
100 % Meth Urea                               
(50 lbs/bag)

142 Bags

2
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: 20-0-10, 
60% Meth Urea                                  
(50 lbs/bag) 

144 Bags

3
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:12-4-8, 25-
50% Slow Release                          
(50 lbs/bag)

20 Bags

4
Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 14-25-12, 
25-50 Slow Release                           
(50 lbs/bag)

21 Bags

5 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 0-22-11, 
w/.25Mg  (50 lbs/bag) 50 Bags

6 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 15-2-15, 
61% WIN w/Micros (50 lbs/bag) 66 Bags

7 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 10-4-16, 
90% Ammonium Sulfate (50 lbs/bag) 30 Bags

8 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 18-4-5, 50% 
Nutralene (50 lbs/bag) 19 Bags

9 Fertilizer - Greens Grade: 21-4-11,  
95% Nutralene 1% Fe (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags

10 Fertilizer -Tee Grade 14-25-10,    25% 
XRT  (50 lbs/bag) 15 Bags

11 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 5-5-15, 
w/Dimension .125 (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags

12 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 14-0-14,        
90% SCU Micros (50 lbs/bag) 18 Bags

13 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 20-0-10,        
60% Meth Urea/UF (50 lbs/bag) 19 Bags

14 Fertilizer - Tee Grade 33-3-6,        
50% XRT (50 lbs/bag) 12 Bags

15 Fertilizer - Roough Grade 14-0-14,       
w/ Dinmension .160 (50 lbs/bag) 65 Bags

Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
Total Total Total Total

22.45$            3,179.35$       23.00$            3,266.00$       

19.20$            2,764.80$       21.25$            3,060.00$       

No Bid -$                10.60$            212.00$          

26.33$            552.93$          13.50$            283.50$          

No Bid -$                21.88$            1,094.00$       

23.52$            1,552.32$       20.61$            1,360.26$       

19.90$            597.00$          20.61$            618.30$          

No Bid -$                21.50$            408.50$          

26.73$            481.14$          23.00$            414.00$          

23.28$            349.20$          27.75$            416.25$          

14.96$            269.28$          15.02$            270.36$          

25.23$            454.14$          26.00$            468.00$          

22.58$            429.02$          20.10$            381.90$          

No Bid -$                12.82$            153.84$          

15.65$            1,017.25$       18.15$            1,179.75$       

Southwest Landmark, Inc.
818 US 42 Street

Lebanon, OH 45036
(513) 932-8904

Helena Chemical Co.
800 Distribution Dr.

Columbus, OH 43228
(614) 551-9534
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of 
 Quantity Measure

16 Fertilizer - Roough Grade 25-5-12,       
50% SCU (50 lbs/bag) 180 Bags

17 Triplet - (2,4-D, Mecroprop, Dicamba) 
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases

18 Round-Up Pro                                (2 
x 2.5 Gal/Case) 8 Cases

19 Athletic Field  Seed Mixture 78% Tall 
Fescue, Ryes, Blue (50 lbs/bag) 1500 lbs

20 Chlorothalonil (ex. Mainsail)              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 10 Cases

21 Daconil - WS                                      
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 20 Cases

22 Primo Max                                         
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 1 Case 

23 Proxy                                                   
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases

24 Instrata                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases

25 Bensumec 4 LF                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2 Cases

26 Concert                                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 21 Cases

27 Curalan                                               
(12 X 2.75 Lbs/Case) 4 Cases

28 Legacy                                               
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 2.5 Gal

29 Bifenthrin 7.9% SC                               
(4 X 1 Gal/Case) 2 Cases

30 Ferromec AC 15-0-0,6% FE                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 20 Cases

31 Headway                                          
(2 X 1 Gal/Case) 11 Cases

32 Meridian 25WG                                     
(4 X 17 oz/Case) 8 Cases

33 Chipco Signature                                   
(4 X 5.5 lbs./Case) 4 Cases

34 Propaconizole                                        
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases

35 Scimitar                                               
(1Qt Bottle) 9 Quarts

Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
Total Total Total Total

Southwest Landmark, Inc.
818 US 42 Street

Lebanon, OH 45036
(513) 932-8904

Helena Chemical Co.
800 Distribution Dr.

Columbus, OH 43228
(614) 551-9534

12.81$            2,305.80$       14.41$            2,593.80$       

No Bid -$                27.47$            549.40$          

15.20$            608.00$          27.50$            1,100.00$       

0.86$              1,282.50$       1.20$              1,800.00$       

32.00$            1,600.00$       36.50$            1,825.00$       

No Bid -$                56.50$            5,650.00$       

No Bid -$                275.00$          550.00$          

No Bid -$                38.54$            385.40$          

No Bid -$                153.80$          2,307.00$       

95.76$            957.60$          88.26$            882.60$          

No Bid -$                78.00$            8,190.00$       

No Bid -$                1,138.50$       4,554.00$       

No Bid -$                391.40$          978.50$          

35.25$            282.00$          34.00$            272.00$          

No Bid -$                9.46$              946.00$          

No Bid -$                405.00$          17,820.00$     

No Bid -$                6.00$              3,264.00$       

No Bid -$                24.48$            2,154.24$       

95.12$            1,426.80$       120.00$          1,800.00$       

No Bid -$                127.08$          4,623.12$       
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 8, 2010
PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of 
 Quantity Measure

36 Clearys 3336 plus                                  
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 7 Cases

37 Chipco 26019                                         
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 11 Cases

38 Stressphiter                                            
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 21 Cases

39 Quicksilver                                            
(8 oz bottles) 7 Bottles

40 Sticker                                              
(4 X 1 Gal/Case) 1 Gal

41 Manganese                                             
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases

42 Echo Ultimate 150 lbs

43 Emerald                                              
(3 x .49 lbs/bag) 1 Case

44 True Foliar P 6-12-6                              
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 1 Case

45 True Foliar N 19-1-6                             
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 4 Cases

46 True Foliar Ca                                        
(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 1 Case

47 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal
48 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal

Total

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Departm
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lo
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and t

Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost
Total Total Total Total

Southwest Landmark, Inc.
818 US 42 Street

Lebanon, OH 45036
(513) 932-8904

Helena Chemical Co.
800 Distribution Dr.

Columbus, OH 43228
(614) 551-9534

67.86$            2,375.10$       230.00$          8,050.00$       

50.20$            2,761.00$       57.00$            3,135.00$       

20.25$            2,126.25$       26.00$            2,730.00$       

No Bid -$                116.02$          812.14$          

No Bid -$                10.50$            10.50$            

No Bid -$                11.00$            220.00$          

No Bid -$                6.10$              915.00$          

No Bid -$                142.10$          1,421.00$       

No Bid -$                35.00$            175.00$          

No Bid -$                16.00$            320.00$          

No Bid -$                7.00$              35.00$            

59.10$            472.80$          31.00$            248.00$          
82.94$            1,327.04$       31.00$            496.00$          

30,023.39$     89,868.00$     
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