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City of Fairfield, Ohio 
Bid Opening - Results 

 
Project(s): Chemicals for Water Department 
Project Estimate: N/A 
Date: Monday, February 6, 2012 (City of Fairfield, Council Chambers) 
 

Contractor 
(Name & Address) 

Chlorine 
(15-1 Ton  
Cylinder) 

Chlorine 
(5-150 lb.) 

 

Sodium 
Hypochlorite 
(as needed) 

 

Liquid  
Carbon 
Dioxide 

(Qt. N/A) 

Hydrofluoro
-silic Acid 
(Qt. N/A) 

Bid 
Security 

Non-
Collusion 
Affidavit 

PP Taxes 
Affidavit 

 
Brentag Mid-South 
134 Reliance Drive 
Hebron, OH 43004 
740-928-3000 

 
Year 1  
$24.25/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 2 
$24.75/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 3 
$25.50/cwt 
 

 
Year 1 
$45.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 2 
$50.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 3 
$52.00/cwt 

 
Year 1 
$8.00/1 gal 
$53.00/15gal 
$112.00 /55 gal
 
Year 2 
$9.00 /1 gal 
$55.00 /15 gal 
$118.00 /55 gal
 
Year 3 
$10.00 /1 gal 
$59.00 /15 gal 
$124.00 /55 gal 

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 

 

 
Year 1 
$4.42 / 1gal 
$0.43 /55 gal 
 
 
Year 2 
$4.59 / 1gal 
$0.45 /55 gal 
 
 
Year 3 
$4.62 / 1gal 
$0.45 /55 gal 
 

 
Yes(Bond) 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 

 
JCI Jones Chemicals 
Inc. 
1765 Ringling Blvd. 
Sarasota, FL 34236 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Year 1  
$22.50/cwt 
 
Year 2 
$22.50/cwt 
 
Year 3 
$25.50/cwt 
 

 
Year 1 
$36.67/cwt 
 
Year 2 
$36.67/cwt 
 
Year 3 
$36.67/cwt 

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
Year 3 
No Bid  

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
Year 3 
No Bid  

 
Yes(Bond) 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 
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City of Fairfield, Ohio 
Bid Opening – Results Cont.- 

 
 

Contractor 
(Name & Address) 

Chlorine 
(15-1 Ton  
Cylinder) 

Chlorine 
(5-150 lb.) 

 

Sodium 
Hypochlorite 
(as needed) 

 

Liquid  
Carbon 
Dioxide 

(Qt. N/A) 

Hydrofluoro
-silic Acid 
(Qt. N/A) 

Bid 
Security 

Non-
Collusion 
Affidavit 

PP Taxes 
Affidavit 

 
Univar USA Inc. 
4600 Dues Drive 
Cincinnati, OH 45246 
513-714-5264 
 
 

 
Year 1  
$27.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 2 
$28.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 3 
$28.00/cwt 
 

 
Year 1 
$45.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 2 
$45.00/cwt 
 
 
 
Year 3 
$48.00/cwt 

 
Year 1 
No Bid/1 gal 
$4.00 /15gal 
$1.95 /55 gal 
 
Year 2 
No Bid /1 gal 
$4.00 /15 gal 
$1.95 /55 gal 
 
Year 3 
No Bid /1 gal 
$4.00 /15 gal 
$1.95 /55 gal 

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 

 

 
Year 1 
$0.47 /55 gal 
 
 
 
Year 2 
$0.47 /55 gal 
 
 
 
Year 3 
$0.47 /55 gal 
 

 
Yes(Bond) 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 

 
PVS Nolwood 
Chemicals, Inc. 
10900 Harper Avenue 
Detroit, MI 48213 
 
 
 

 
Year 1  
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 
 

 
Year 1  
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 
 

 
Year 1 
No Bid/1 gal 
$33.75 /15gal 
$96.25 /55 gal 
 
Year 2 
No Bid /1 gal 
No Bid /15 gal 
No Bid /55 gal 
 
Year 3 
No Bid /1 gal 
No Bid /15 gal 
No Bid /55 gal 

 
Year 1 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid 
 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid 

 

 
Year 1 
No Bid/ 1gal 
$0.47 / gal 
 
 
Year 2 
No Bid/ 1gal 
No Bid/ gal 
 
 
Year 3 
No Bid/ 1gal 
No Bid/ gal 
 

 
Yes(Bond) 

 
Yes 

 
Yes 
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City of Fairfield, Ohio 

Bid Opening – Results Cont. - 
 
 

Contractor 
(Name & Address) 

Chlorine 
(15-1 Ton  
Cylinder) 

Chlorine 
(5-150 lb.) 

 

Sodium 
Hypochlorite 
(as needed) 

 

Liquid  
Carbon 
Dioxide 

(Qt. N/A) 

Hydrofluoro
-silic Acid 
(Qt. N/A) 

Bid 
Security 

Non-
Collusion 
Affidavit 

PP Taxes 
Affidavit 

 
Kemira Water Solutions 
3211 Clinton Parkway 
Ct. 
Lawrence, KS 66047 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
N/A 

 
N/A 

 
N/A 

 
Sal Chemical 
3036 Birch Drive 
Weirton, WV 26062 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
N/A 

 
N/A 

 
N/A 

 
**  These bids will be reviewed by the Public Utilities Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.  There is no guarantee that 
the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.  Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest bid. 
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