
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 6, 2012

PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost

 Quantity Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:              

100% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag)
90 Bags  $            36.80 3,312.00$       32.07$            2,886.30$       33.00$            2,970.00$       28.00$            2,520.00$       No bid -$                

2
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                 

60% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag)
85 Bags  $            33.00 2,805.00$       27.99$            2,379.15$       28.75$            2,443.75$       25.00$            2,125.00$       No bid -$                

3
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                

25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag)
20 Bags  No Bid -$                No Bid -$                22.60$            452.00$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

4
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                 

25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag)
31 Bags 44.90$            1,391.90$       29.28$            907.68$          36.50$            1,131.50$       No Bid -$                No bid -$                

5
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                  

w/.25Mg 0-0-22-11 (50 lbs/bag)
35 Bags 23.75$            831.25$          13.30$            465.50$          20.00$            700.00$          17.00$            595.00$          No bid -$                

6

Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                

65% MU w/Micros                          18-

6-15 (50 lbs/bag)

54 Bags 40.10$            2,165.40$       41.77$            2,255.58$       35.30$            1,906.20$       33.45$            1,806.30$       29.50$            1,593.00$       

7

Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                     

90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 

Micros 13-2-13 (50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags 33.40$            1,002.00$       21.76$            652.80$          28.30$            849.00$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

8

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                       

18% MU w/Micros                             

19-26-5 (50 lbs/bag)

13 Bags No Bid -$                25.18$            327.34$          32.00$            416.00$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

9

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           

w/Dimension .125                             5-

5-20 (50 lbs/bag)

18 Bags 30.00$            540.00$          26.87$            483.66$          30.25$            544.50$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

10

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           

50% NY/UF                                          

25-5-15 (50 lbs/bag)

16 Bags No Bid -$                27.99$            447.84$          34.20$            547.20$          23.00$            368.00$          No bid -$                

11
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             

50% SCU 25-0-3 (50 lbs/bag)
19 Bags No Bid -$                14.89$            282.91$          15.00$            285.00$          22.00$            418.00$          No bid -$                

12
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             

93% Nutralene 17-3-17 (50 lbs/bag)
25 Bags 39.00$            975.00$          29.07$            726.75$          31.00$            775.00$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

13
Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                          

50% SCU  25-5-12 (50 lbs/bag)
130 Bags 22.00$            2,860.00$       15.20$            1,976.00$       22.90$            2,977.00$       22.00$            2,860.00$       18.20$            2,366.00$       

14

Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                      

w/ Dimension .160 5-5-15                     

(50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No Bid -$                No bid -$                

15
Kphite Systemic Fungicide 

(Phosphorous Acid) 55%
100 Gals. No Bid -$                53.00$            5,300.00$       29.50$            2,950.00$       30.00$            3,000.00$       20.98$            2,098.00$       

16
Renown                                             

(2 x 2.5 Gal./Case)
12.5 Gal 1,015.00$       2,537.50$       203.00$          2,537.50$       203.00$          2,537.50$       203.00$          2,537.50$       203.00$          2,537.50$       

17
Chlorothalonil                                  (2 

X 2.5 Gal/Case)
20 Cases 143.00$          2,860.00$       130.00$          2,600.00$       155.00$          3,100.00$       142.00$          2,840.00$       25.79$            2,579.00$       

18
Instrata                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
42.5 Gal 337.50$          2,868.75$       156.00$          6,630.00$       135.00$          5,737.50$       135.00$          5,737.50$       135.00$          5,737.50$       

19
Concert                                              

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
11 Cases 190.00$          2,090.00$       380.00$          4,180.00$       380.00$          4,180.00$       342.00$          3,762.00$       76.00$            4,180.00$       

20
Curalan                                               

(Drums/Kegs))
6

Drums/ 

Kegs
990.00$          5,940.00$       1,122.00$       6,732.00$       1,089.00$       6,534.00$       990.00$          5,940.00$       1,023.00$       6,138.00$       

The Hill Co.

2776 Circleport Drive

Erlanger, KY 41018

859-815-8320

Helena Chemical Co.

902 Greengate Dr.

Lebannon, OH 45036

513-314-1591

Green Velvet Sod Farms

3620 Upper Bellbrook Road

Bellbrook, OH 45305

John Deere Landscapes

1385 East 36th Street

216-706-9250

Cleveland, OH 44114

Harrell's 

720 Kraft Rod

Lakeland, FL 33815

800-282-8007
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The Hill Co.

2776 Circleport Drive

Erlanger, KY 41018

859-815-8320

Helena Chemical Co.

902 Greengate Dr.

Lebannon, OH 45036

513-314-1591

Green Velvet Sod Farms

3620 Upper Bellbrook Road

Bellbrook, OH 45305

John Deere Landscapes

1385 East 36th Street

216-706-9250

Cleveland, OH 44114

Harrell's 

720 Kraft Rod

Lakeland, FL 33815

800-282-8007

21
Medallion                                                         

(2 x 16 x 5)
1 bulk/pk 2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       2,584.00$       16.15$            2,584.00$       

22
Headway                                          (2 

X 1 Gal/Case)
14 Gal  $       4,060.00 5,704.00$       411.00$          5,754.00$       406.00$          4,060.00$       411.00$          5,754.00$       411.00$          5,754.00$       

23
Propaconizole                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
5 Cases 367.00$          1,835.00$       400.00$          2,000.00$       450.00$          2,250.00$       72.00$            1,800.00$       73.49$            1,837.25$       

24
Clearys 3336 plus                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
6 Cases 460.00$          2,760.00$       348.00$          2,088.00$       460.00$          2,760.00$       460.00$          2,760.00$       55.08$            1,652.40$       

25 Banol / Equivalent 5 Gal 1,850.00$       1,850.00$       372.90$          1,864.50$       420.00$          2,100.00$       370.00$          1,850.00$       291.45$          1,457.25$       

26
Emerald                                              

(3 x .49 lbs/bag)
6.37 lbs 142.10$          1,847.30$        $          143.08 1,860.04$       142.10$          1,847.30$       142.00$          1,846.00$       143.08$          429.24$          

27
Iprodione                                              

(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
8 Cases 239.00$          1,912.00$        $          214.40 1,715.20$       270.00$          2,160.00$       220.00$          1,760.00$       40.97$            1,638.80$       

28
Triplet                                                  

(2x 2.5 gal/case)
5 Cases 123.00$          615.00$           $          122.64 613.20$          136.25$          681.25$          No Bid -$                20.00$            500.00$          

29
Proxy                                                     

(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
3 Cases 166.00$          498.00$           $          260.00 780.00$          233.50$          700.50$          210.00$          630.00$          23.94$            359.10$          

30 Round Up 5 Cases 79.00$            395.00$           $            98.00 490.00$          132.50$          662.50$          65.00$            325.00$          10.50$            262.50$          

31 Bensumec 2.5 Cases 448.00$          1,120.00$        $          594.18 1,485.45$       545.00$          1,362.50$       265.00$          265.00$          87.50$            437.50$          

32 Surflan 6 Cases No Bid -$                 $            58.05 696.60$          261.50$          1,569.00$       290.00$          1,740.00$       49.00$            1,470.00$       

33 Drive DF 8 lbs 55.50$              $            45.00 360.00$          55.00$            440.00$          57.00$            456.00$          39.00$            312.00$          

34 Accelypryn 2 Gal 880.00$          3,520.00$        $       1,760.00 3,520.00$       880.00$          3,520.00$       1,760.00$       3,520.00$       880.00$          3,520.00$       

35 Scimitar 2 Qrts 149.00$          298.00$           $          149.89 299.78$          144.00$          288.00$          150.00$          300.00$          129.90$          259.80$          

36 Ferromec AC 5 Cases 59.00$            295.00$           $            37.68 188.40$          53.00$            265.00$          60.00$            300.00$          6.88$              172.00$          

37 Stressphiter 5 Cases 109.00$          545.00$           $          112.60 563.00$          147.50$          737.50$          75.00$            375.00$          20.00$            500.00$          

38 Manganese 4 Cases 79.00$            316.00$           $            42.46 169.84$          185.50$          742.00$          80.00$            320.00$          10.50$            210.00$          

39 True Foliar P 2 Cases 197.60$          395.20$           No Bid -$                36.50$            365.00$          No Bid -$                No bid -$                

40 True Foliar Ca 2 Cases 235.60$          471.20$           $            38.16 76.32$            230.00$          460.00$          80.00$            160.00$          11.50$            115.00$          

41 Sticker 2 Gal 25.00$            50.00$             $            28.26 56.52$            30.00$            60.00$            40.00$            80.00$            13.00$            26.00$            

42 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal 49.70$            397.60$          No Bid -$                42.00$            336.00$          52.00$            416.00$          28.00$            224.00$          

43 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal 66.00$            1,056.00$       No Bid -$                52.00$            832.00$          56.00$            896.00$          28.00$            448.00$          

44 Snapshot Pre M 45 Bags 87.00$            3,915.00$       70.00$            3,150.00$       78.00$            3,510.00$       85.75$            3,858.75$       1.45$              3,262.50$       

45 Turf Type Tall Fescue Blend 1500 Lbs 1.25$              1,875.00$       0.88$              1,320.00$       0.93$              1,395.00$       0.85$              1,275.00$       No bid -$                

46 Penncross Ben Seed 75 lbs 9.95$              746.25$          7.30$              547.50$          7.25$              543.75$          6.75$              506.25$          No bid -$                

Total 67,179.35$     88,926.13$     86,681.20$     68,286.30$     54,660.34$     

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.

There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.

Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of 

 Quantity Measure

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:              

100% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag)
90 Bags

2
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                 

60% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag)
85 Bags

3
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:                

25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag)
20 Bags

4
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                 

25-50% Slow Release (50 lbs/bag)
31 Bags

5
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                  

w/.25Mg 0-0-22-11 (50 lbs/bag)
35 Bags

6

Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                

65% MU w/Micros                          18-

6-15 (50 lbs/bag)

54 Bags

7

Fertilizer - Greens Grade:                     

90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 

Micros 13-2-13 (50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags

8

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                       

18% MU w/Micros                             

19-26-5 (50 lbs/bag)

13 Bags

9

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           

w/Dimension .125                             5-

5-20 (50 lbs/bag)

18 Bags

10

Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                           

50% NY/UF                                          

25-5-15 (50 lbs/bag)

16 Bags

11
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             

50% SCU 25-0-3 (50 lbs/bag)
19 Bags

12
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:                             

93% Nutralene 17-3-17 (50 lbs/bag)
25 Bags

13
Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                          

50% SCU  25-5-12 (50 lbs/bag)
130 Bags

14

Fertilizer - Roough Grade:                      

w/ Dimension .160 5-5-15                     

(50 lbs/bag)

30 Bags

15
Kphite Systemic Fungicide 

(Phosphorous Acid) 55%
100 Gals.

16
Renown                                             

(2 x 2.5 Gal./Case)
12.5 Gal

17
Chlorothalonil                                  (2 

X 2.5 Gal/Case)
20 Cases

18
Instrata                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
42.5 Gal

19
Concert                                              

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
11 Cases

20
Curalan                                               

(Drums/Kegs))
6

Drums/ 

Kegs

Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost

Total Total Total Total

35.00$            3,150.00$       25.97$            2,337.30$       

22.00$            1,870.00$       23.37$            1,986.05$       

25.36$            507.20$          No Bid -$                

40.00$            1,240.00$       34.02$            1,054.54$       

No Bid -$                39.63$            1,387.20$       

33.00$            1,782.00$       25.59$            1,381.89$       

24.00$            720.00$          25.85$            775.50$          

36.00$            468.00$          28.71$            373.23$          

32.00$            576.00$          No Bid -$                

39.00$            624.00$          24.53$            392.48$          

No Bid -$                21.54$            409.26$          

33.00$            825.00$          23.78$            594.51$          

21.00$            2,730.00$       15.19$            1,974.70$       

No Bid -$                16.82$            504.60$          

130.00$          2,600.00$       31.90$            3,190.00$       

1,015.00$       2,537.50$       No Bid -$                

151.63$          3,032.60$       28.53$            2,853.00$       

780.00$          6,630.00$       135.00$          5,737.50$       

380.00$          4,180.00$       76.00$            4,180.00$       

1,023.00$       4,287.26$       31.00$            6,138.00$       

Cincinnati, OH  45232

859-512-4838

Trupointe Cooperative, Inc.

818 South US 42

Lebanon, OH  45036

513-932-8904

Residex-Turfgrass

5865 Highland Ridge Dr.
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Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 6, 2012

PROJECT:  Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Item Description Estimated Unit of 

 Quantity Measure

1
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:              

100% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag)
90 Bags21

Medallion                                                         

(2 x 16 x 5)
1 bulk/pk

22
Headway                                          (2 

X 1 Gal/Case)
14 Gal

23
Propaconizole                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
5 Cases

24
Clearys 3336 plus                                               

(2 X 2.5 Gal/Case)
6 Cases

25 Banol / Equivalent 5 Gal

26
Emerald                                              

(3 x .49 lbs/bag)
6.37 lbs

27
Iprodione                                              

(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
8 Cases

28
Triplet                                                  

(2x 2.5 gal/case)
5 Cases

29
Proxy                                                     

(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
3 Cases

30 Round Up 5 Cases

31 Bensumec 2.5 Cases

32 Surflan 6 Cases

33 Drive DF 8 lbs

34 Accelypryn 2 Gal

35 Scimitar 2 Qrts

36 Ferromec AC 5 Cases

37 Stressphiter 5 Cases

38 Manganese 4 Cases

39 True Foliar P 2 Cases

40 True Foliar Ca 2 Cases

41 Sticker 2 Gal

42 Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal

43 OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal

44 Snapshot Pre M 45 Bags

45 Turf Type Tall Fescue Blend 1500 Lbs

46 Penncross Ben Seed 75 lbs

Total

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.

There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.

Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.

Unit Cost Item  Cost Unit Cost Item  Cost

Total Total Total Total

Cincinnati, OH  45232

859-512-4838

Trupointe Cooperative, Inc.

818 South US 42

Lebanon, OH  45036

513-932-8904

Residex-Turfgrass

5865 Highland Ridge Dr.

2,584.00$       2,584.00$       15.15$            2,584.00$       

822.00$          5,754.00$       400.00$          5,644.00$       

321.83$          1,609.15$       81.71$            2,042.75$       

460.00$          2,760.00$       71.51$            2,145.30$       

730.30$          1,825.75$       318.37$          1,591.85$       

426.30$          1,847.30$       No Bid -$                

210.00$          1,680.00$       54.50$            2,180.00$       

120.00$          600.00$          23.89$            597.25$          

215.00$          645.00$          No Bid -$                

73.96$            369.80$          14.94$            373.50$          

550.00$          1,375.00$       No Bid -$                

345.00$          2,070.00$       47.16$            1,414.80$       

250.00$          500.00$          45.89$            367.12$          

880.00$          3,520.00$       No Bid -$                

150.00$          300.00$          No Bid -$                

58.00$            290.00$          9.20$              230.00$          

130.00$          650.00$          23.24$            581.00$          

202.50$          822.00$          No Bid -$                

No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

190.00$          380.00$          No Bid -$                

45.00$            90.00$            32.25$            64.50$            

No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

No Bid -$                No Bid -$                

95.00$            4,275.00$       1.65$              3,712.50$       

1.00$              1,500.00$       0.99$              1,480.50$       

9.00$              675.00$          No Bid -$                

73,881.56$     60,278.83$     
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