City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 17, 2015 The Hill Co. John Deere Landscapes Green Velvet Sod Farms Harrell's Helena Chemical Co.
PROJECT: Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept. 2776 Circleport Drive 1385 East 36th Street 3620 Upper Bellbrook Road 720 Kraft Rod 902 Greengate Dr.
Erlanger, KY 41018 Cleveland, OH 44114 Bellbrook, OH 45305 Lakeland, FL 33815 Lebannon, OH 45036
859-815-8320 216-706-9250 800-282-8007 513-314-1591
[item Description Estimated| Unit of Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost
Quantity | Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: . )
1 100% Meth Urea (50 Ibs/bag) 85 Bags No Bid $ $ 21951 % 1,865.75 | $ 3089| % 2,62565|% 3168| % 2,692801% 2625|%  2,231.25
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade: . R
2 60% Meth Urea (50 lbs/bag) 80 Bags No Bid $ $ 2695|% 2,156.00]$ 27.111% 2,16880% $ 27.101$  2,168.00| $ 24.00( $ 1,920.00
Fertilizer - Tee Grade: . . R
3 17-3-17 93% NS-54 (50 Ibs/bag) 22 Bags No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 3098 $ 681.56 No Bid 3 - $ 27.751 % 610.50
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
4 25-50% Slow Release (50 Ibs/bag) 20 Bags | $ 4760] % 952.001 $ 2660 | $ 532001 $ 3219|$% 643801 $ 320019 640001 $ 26.50 | $ 530.00
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:
5|22-0-16 .125 Dimension,1% 45 Bags No Bid $ - $ 18.00 | $ 810.00| $ 5249 |$ 236205 No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
Ronstar(50 lbs/bag)
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
6165% MU w/Micros 184 50 Bags | $ 3490 $ 1,74500 | $ 50001% 3,15000]18% 33371% 1,668.50 | $ 33.00| % 1,650.00 | $ 27751 % 1,387.50
6-15 (50 Ibs/bag)
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
7190% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 30 Bags | $ 3449| % 1,03470 | $ 2025 (% 607501 $ 2743 | $ 82290 No Bid $ - $ 209118 627.30
Micros 13-2-13 (50 lbs/bag)
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:
8118% MU w/Micros 15 Bags No Bid $ - $ 25201 % 378001 $ 2893 | $ 433.95 No Bid 3 - No Bid $ -
19-26-5 (50 Ibs/bag)
Barricasde (Prodiamine)
91(6/5 Ib. case) 1 Case $ 607.50| $ 607.50]1 $ 31500 $ 31500} $ 291.00 | $ 291001 $ 326.00 | % 32600 $ 9101 % 273.00
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:
10{50% MU/UF 15 Bags No Bid $ - No Bid $ - $ 3162 $ 474301 $ 27001 $ 405001 $ 24001 $% 360.00
25-5-15 (50 lbs/bag)
1 [Pefendor 1X (1Gal. /2 Gal 1 Pail |$ 126900|$ 126900)$ 1,05000|$ 1,05000] NoBid |$ - |s 1150008 1,15000]% 101600|8 1,016.00
Dimension ECW)
12 |Fertilizer - (Sprayable) 18-3-4 20 Gal $ 21501 $ 430.00 ] § 112018 224001 $ 11631 8% 232601 % 1200 | $ 240.00 1 $§ 1200 | $ 240.00
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:
13 50% SCU 25-5-12 (50 Ibs/bag) 125 Bags | $ 220018 275000]| $ 1650(% 206250] % 1469 | $ 1,836.25] % 18801!% 2350.00] $ 15751 % 1,968.75
14 [Fortify 6-0-0 (2X 2.5 Gal./Case) 10 Gal $ 230.00] $ 460.00 } $ 15.60 | $ 156.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 25001 % 25000 | $ 90.00 | $ 900.00
15| Kphite Systemic Fungicide 75 Gal | 2395|s 17925|s  3600|s 270000]s  2233|s 167475]s  3000|s 2250008  3600]$ 2700.00
(Phosphorous Acid) 55%
16 g‘;“‘;sg(asl‘;'i:‘s‘;“’°“°) 3 Gal |$ 1,13600{s 3408005 1450008 4350008 1153443 346032|s 60000|S 360000|8 s55500|$ 333000
] N @ s Cases |  13900|s 69500]s 13400|s  e67000|s 12465|s3 e2325|s 17500(s  87500|S  18000|S  900.00
.5 Gal/Case)
Instrata .
18 (2X 2.5 Gal/Case) 12.5 Gal $ 158.00] $ 1975001 $ 158.001 % 1,975.00 No Bid $ - $ 158.00 | $ 1,975.00| $ 158.00 | $ 1,975.00
Concert .
19 (2X 2.5 Gal/Case) 130 Gal $ 6840|3% 889200} % 6840 | %  8,892.00 No Bid $ - $ 6840 (% 8,89200] $ 76.001% 9,880.00
Secure 2 .
20 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 235 Gal $ 565.00| $ 1327750] $ 565.00 | $ 13,277.50 No Bid $ - $ 565.00 | $ 13277.501 $ 565.00 | $ 13,277.50
Medallion ,
21 (2% 16 x 5) Case 8 Gal $ 550.001$ 4400001 $ 55000 | $ 4,400.00 No Bid $ - $ 550.00|$ 4,40000] $ 550.00 | $  4,400.00
22|Heritage WDG (1 LB) 9 Lbs $ 317.00|$ 2853.00]1 % 317.001 $  2,853.00 No Bid $ - $ 317.001$§ 23853001 % 317.00{$  2,853.00
Propaconizole
23 2x 2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases | $ 31750 $ 952501 $ 300.00 | $ 900001 $ 288.28 86484 | $ 69.001% 1,035001 $ 56751 % 851.25
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City of Fairfield

Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 17, 2015
PROJECT: Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

The Hill Co.
2776 Circleport Drive
Erlanger, KY 41018
859-815-8320

John Deere Landscapes
1385 East 36th Street
Cleveland, OH 44114

216-706-9250

Green Velvet Sod Farms
3620 Upper Bellbrook Road
Bellbrook, OH 45305

Harrell's
720 Kraft Rod
Lakeland, FL 33815
800-282-8007

Helena Chemical Co.
902 Greengate Dr.
Lebannon, OH 45036
513-314-1591

fitem Description Estimated| Unit of Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost
Quantity | Measure Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total
24|TMeth Thiophanate 4 Cases |8 24000]8  96000|s 320005 128000]Ss 32286 |5 129144]s 5560 |$  1,11200|$  24250|S  970.00
(2 x 2.5 Gal/Case)
25| Banner Max Ii 7 Ga |s 214005 149800|$ 21400|$ 149800} NoBid |$ - |s 21400|s 1498005 21400|S 149800
(2 x 1 Gal/Case)
Megalex 3-0-0 . . . .
26]07 22 Gal/case) 6 Cases NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ - |s 22500|s 135000| NoBid |3 . NoBid |$ -
27 |Heritage FP (6 LB) 2 Lbs |8 1,90200] 5  7.608.00]$ _ 317.00|$ 760800] NoBid |$ — |5 1902008 760800]8  317.00|5 _ 7.608.00
28> Way Weed Spray 12 | cases |$  11900(s 14280005 11600fs 139200]s 11566|s 138792|s  12000($ 154800|$  11250{$  1,350.00
(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
29 g‘;"; 5 galicase) 3 Case |$ 165.00($  49500|%  18200($  546.00 14882 |$ 44646 S  20000|$  60000]$  13250|%  397.50
30]Round Up (2 x 2.5gal/case) 9 Cases | § 9500] 8 85500 88.00]% __ 792.00 7614 |5 68526]% _ 79.00|% _ 711.00| S 1500 ]S 675.00
31|Bensumec (2 x | gal/case) 125 | Gal |$ 98.40|$ 12300018 11400]8$ 14250006 10797 [$ _ 26993| 5 11600]S 145000] § 10900 |$ _ 1,362.50
32[Dac Action (2 x 2.5gal/case) 525 | Gal |$ 7400] 5 3.885.00] S 7400]8 3,88500] NoBid |$ - |5 7400[$ 3288500]5 74005 _ 3,885.00
33[TGR Paclobutrazol 10 Gal | $__ 179.00]$ 1,79000]S _ 185008 185000] $ _ 187.48|$ 1,87480] S _ 180.00|$ 1,800.00] S _ 148.00|S _ 1,480.00
34| Accelypryn 2 Gal | $  185500]$ 3.71000] S 1855008 3,71000] NoBid |$ - |5 1855008 37100015 1855.00|$ _ 3,710.00
35| Primo Maxx (1 ga) 5 Gal | S 283.00]$ 141500] S _ 109608 _ 54800] NoBid |$ - IS 130005 650005 _ 283.00|$ _ 1415.00
36 Ferromec AC (2 x 2.5 galicase) 2 Cases | $ 69.00[$ 13800035 3500]$ 70005 4962($ 99245 56008 1120015 3500]S 70.00
37|Cytozorb-S (2 x 2.5 galicase) 5 Cases | $ 227508 LI3750|$ 75000 |$  3,750.00 | § _ 227508  1,13750]$ __ 200.00|$ 1,00000| NoBid [$ -
38 Nitroplast-S (2 x 2.5 gal/casc) 1 Case | S 17600]$ __ 17600] S 112005 _ 11200|$ _ 17600]$ _ 17600] NoBid |$ - NoBid__|$ -
39[PTO (2 x 2.5 galicase) 5 Gal |$ _ 18250|8 18250 S 13.60 [ 68.00] 8 36508 18250] NoBid |$ - NoBid | $ -
40|Mojave Imazypyr (2 x Slb/case) 50 Lbs No Bid $ - $ 9751 % 487.50] § 1033 1% 516.50 No Bid $ - $ 102518 512.50
41|Penncross Bent Seed 125 Lbs | 78015 975.00] S 780]1% _ 975.00] 5 788 ]S 98500] 752|$ __ 94000] S 804 1% 1,005.00
42| Conduit Wetting Agent 8 Gal | s 5830]$ _ 93280] NoBid |$ ~ |s  4350]s 32625185  3800|8 30400 | S 63.00]8 _ 504.00
43|OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal _|s 75.00]$ _ 1,20000] NoBid _|$ IS 5632]5 _ 84480] s __ 8000|S 128000]$ __ 50.00|S __ 800.00
44|Free Hand 45 Bags | 87.50| 8 3,937.50| 8 90.00 |8 405000 $ __ 90.00|$ 4,05000] S __ 90.00]%  4,050.00] S __ 90.00 [$ _ 4,050.00
45 (Ts‘z)’ﬁgsy/g:;"“““eme“d 1500 | Lbs |$ 1245 186000 s 124|$ 186000 |s 119|s 178500 s 119|s 1,78500fS 6098 |$  1,829.40
Total S $2910.75 S _ 89,230.75 S 38,733.12 S 85,072.30 $_ 85,352.95

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Department and a recommendation will be made to Council.
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the lowest bidder.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and the lowest.
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City of Fairfield
Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 17, 2015
PROJECT: Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept.

Residex-Turfgrass
5865 Highland Ridge Dr.

Trupointe Cooperative Inc.
P.O. Box 117, 818 South US 42

Cincinnati, OH 45232 Lebanon, OH 45036
859-512-4838
Item Description Estimated| Unit of Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost
Quantity | Measure Total Total Total Total
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:
1 100% Meth Urea (50 Ibs/bag) 85 Bags | $ 33.00(% 2,80500)$ 1740 $ 1,479.00
Fertilizer - Fairway Grade:
2 60% Meth Urea (50 Ibs/bag) 80 Bags | $ 33.000 % 2640001 $ 17.40( $ 1,392.00
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:
3 17-3-17 93% NS-54 (50 Ibs/bag) 22 Bags | $ 18551 % 408.101'% 3231} % 710.82
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
4 25-50% Slow Release (50 Ibs/bag) 20 Bags $ 28751 % 575001 % 2896 | $ 579.20
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:
5|22-0-16 .125 Dimension,1% 45 Bags | $ 5525 (%  2,486.25 No Bid $ -
Ronstar(50 lbs/bag)
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
6[65% MU w/Micros 18 50 Bags | $ 2985|$ 1,49250 ) $ 3231 (% 1,615.50
6-15 (50 Ibs/bag)
Fertilizer - Greens Grade:
7/90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe 30 Bags No Bid 3 - 3 2245 | % 673.50
Micros 13-2-13 (50 Ibs/bag)
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:
8]18% MU w/Micros 15 Bags | $ 3055 % 458251 % 2896 | $ 434.40
19-26-5 (50 lbs/bag)
Barricasde (Prodiamine)
91(6/5 1b. case) 1 Case $ 260.00 | $ 260.001 $ 93518% 280.50
Fertilizer - Tee Grade:
10|50% MU/UF 15 Bags | $ 2450 | % 367.50 No Bid $ -
25-5-15 (50 Ibs/bag)
Defendor 1X (1Gal. / 2 Gal. .
11 Dimension ECW) 1 Pail $ 1,10500|$ 1,105.00 929.00 | $ 929.00
12|Fertilizer - (Sprayable) 18-34 20 Gal $ 1200{ $ 240.00 16.87 | $ 337.40
Fertilizer - Rough Grade:
13 50% SCU 25-5.12 (50 Ibs/bag) 125 Bags | $ 1700 | $  2,125.00 1418 | $ 1,772.50
14|Fortify 6-0-0 (2X 2.5 Gal./Case) 10 Gal $ 48.00 | $ 480.00 No Bid $ -
Kphite Systemic Fungicide
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75 Gal $ 40.00 | $ 3,00000] $ 2127 | $ 1,595.25
16| Smiss Gulfentrazone) 3 Gal |$ s8500($ 351000] NoBid s -
(2 X .5 gal / case)
Chlorothalonil 2
17 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 5 Cases | $ 125.00 | $ 625001 $ 2768 | $ 692.00
Instrata .
18 (2X 2.5 Gal/Case) 12.5 Gal $ 790.00 | $ 1,975.00 No Bid $ -
Concert .
19 @X 2.5 Gal/Case) 130 Gal $ 380.00 | $ 9,880.00 No Bid $ -
Secure @ .
20 X 2.5 Gal/Case) 235 Gal $ 1412503 13,277.50 No Bid $ -
Medallion .
21 (2% 16 x 5) Case 8 Gal $ 55000 | $  4,400.00 No Bid $ -
22|Heritage WDG (1 LB) 9 Lbs $ 317.00] 8  2385300]$ 243.7518  2,925.00
Propaconizole .
23 (2x2.5 Gal/Case) 3 Cases | $ 300.00 | $ 900.00 No Bid $ -
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City of Fairfield

Bid Tabulation for bids opened February 17, 2015 Residex-Turfgrass Trupointe Cooperative Inc.
PROJECT: Fertilizer and Chemicals for Parks Dept. 5865 Highland Ridge Dr. P.O. Box 117, 818 South US 42
Cincinnati, OH 45232 Lebanon, OH 45036
859-512-4838
item Description Estimated| Unit of Unit Cost Item Cost Unit Cost Item Cost
~Quantity | Measure Total Total Total Total
24 (Tz’;‘;“; (T}‘;‘l‘/’g:::)a'e 4 Cases | $  26900|8 1,07600]$  4993|$ 99860
B. Max 1L
25 @ x 1 Gal/Case) 7 G $ 21400 $ 1,498.00 No Bid $ -
26 gefglz"gal‘jc‘)ase) 6 Cases | $  18000|$ 1,08000] NoBid |[$ ;
27 |Heritage FP (6 LB) 24 Lbs $ 1902008 760800 No Bid $ -
28|?ay Weed Spray 12 | Cases [$  11185[$ 134220|s 2149 (S  1289.40
(2 x 2.5 gal/case)
29|Proxy 3 Case |$ 17900($  53700] NoBid |S$ -
2 x 2.5 gal/case)
30]Round Up (2 x 2.5gal/case) 9 Cases | § 9200 § 82800 $ 1508 | § 679.05
31 |Bensumec (2 x 1gal/case) 12.5 Gal $ 11500 [ $ 143750 No Bid $ -
32|Dac Action (2 x 2.5gal/case) 52.5 Gal $ 18500 [ $  3,885.00 No Bid $ -
33| TGR Paclobutrazol 10 Gal $ 198.00 { § 1,980.00 No Bid $ -
34|Accelypryn 2 Gal $ 92750 | §  3,710.00 No Bid $ -
35]Primo Maxx (1 gal) 5 Gal $ 283.00 | § 1,415.00 No Bid $ -
36|Ferromec AC (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 2 Cases | § 60.00 | $ 120.00 | § 869|8% 86.90
37|Cytozorb-S (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 5 Cases | $ 180.00 | $ 900.00 No Bid $ -
38|Nitroplast-S (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 1 Case | $ 77.00 { $ 77.00 No Bid $ -
39|PTO (2 x 2.5 gal/case) 5 Gal $ 31.00 | § 155.00 No Bid $ -
40[Mojave Imazypyr (2 x Slb/case) 50 Lbs No Bid $ - No Bid $ -
41 |Penncross Bent Seed 125 Lbs $ 75018 93750 ] $ 772183 965.00
42]Conduit Wetting Agent [ Gal $ 4000 | $ 320.00 No Bid $ -
43|OARS Wetting Agent 16 Gal [$ 5200 8% 832.00 No Bid $ -
44 |Free Hand 45 Bags $ 90.00 { $ 4,050.00] § 76.19 | $  3,428.55
45| Turf Type Tall Fescue Blend 1500 | Lbs s 120}$  1,800.00 L16|$  1,740.00
(50 lbs/bag)
Total $ 91,451.30 $ 24,603.57

These bids will be reviewed by the Parks & Recreation Depart:
There is no guarantee that the contract will be awarded to the 1.
Contracts are awarded to the bidder deemed to be the best and
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CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum
listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS: E\i\\\ Lo 5«\\0\\(4’\}\ Ane \\u 1 X(CA
&Z_ﬂl 1§ xux Ao\\cq c«k }wc'\ 1}“\"3 CC’“LK

(Amount in Fi’gures) (Amount in Words)

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:

1%
§2 30 .
(Ala tin €s)
> 1 { ten Aol\cf{ cd (’cvcﬂ‘l \Qx‘u eerte

(Amount in Words)

‘E c\\%v\ Yoo thoycend atn

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: u{\ 0n D‘lﬂ uc(%

Please indicate type of Bid Security: [Bid Bond I{ertlﬁed Check OCashier’s Check

Addendum Received I{None “0”)

Signature

lec ‘D \5«:\\ Name
<‘;\L< | OW’\Q" Title
“The \\\\\ @ Company
27176 Gréde Do N Address
Eda s KN Y\ City, State, Zip
§BG- 615 -8 T20  Telephone
2L -4 Y 2971\ Social Security Number of

Company Owner or Federal
A > h ” Tdentification Number
i I

Friapger, KY Location
2776 GrclePort Grive
Lrianger, KY 41018

{P} 859-815-8320  (F} 859-815-8322




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

PRICE
PER UNIT

EXTENDED
PRICE

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% PolyS
25-2-12 (50LBS / Bag)

85 BAGS

INERRD

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
60% Meth Urea/ UF / 65% PolyS
23-2-10 (50 LBS / BAG)

80 BAGS

Vo 3id

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
17-3-17
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG)

22 BAGS

N, Yid

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
25-50% Slow Release ‘N’
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG)

& V- Gvtee DG YWD A\

20 BAGS

&

e

9%2.

FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16
.125 DIMENSION,1% RONSTAR
(50 LBS / BAG)

45 BAGS

(N b BCA

FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE
65% MU w/Micros
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG)

50 BAGS

3y 2

45 =

FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG)

30 BAGS

44

\03‘1.29

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN)
18% MU w/Micros
19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)

15 BAGS

N ()




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY Pé’l':lUCI\ﬁT Exglfll\é%m
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) _ 50
? (6/5LB. CASE) V" 1 CASE " 0 71— (0 0-7 52
Syncesta”/ '
’ =
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
10 50% MU / UF 15 BAGS .
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG) i\) v B.o\
DEFENDOR b c
11 1 PAIL | =
1 X (1 GAL./2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) \ 269" 23—
_ cd
1 FERTIL]ZEI}S_ 3(_S4PRAYABLE) 0GAL | 5| ) \ U3y
é @\m“f Fw& \X -3-L U) '3’% SR'\) 4 N\\C"'N 3 .
FERTILIZER — ROUGH GRADE
13 50% SCU 125 BAGS 2 ab 5 0b
25-5-12 (S0 LBS /B T -
gZ‘S ~0-9 m?!‘\&b(‘t\'}; 4 é’g) Fe_ Z£750.
FORTIFY o~ "
6-0-0 10 GAL < cb
14 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 230. W0
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE I\ 2C
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75 GAL 3. — \7ﬁ b —
%r\ - &\\0 S )
DISMISS ob ot
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3 GAL - =
(2 X .5 GAL / CASE) W3k 3"[0&.
)
CHLOROTHALONIL : = A~ D
17 2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) SCASES | 139. ¢! (9 5




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | ottty
INSTRATA o o
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 12.5 GAL \Se';\ 1915.—
19 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) 130 GAL (8.2 §c42.
'S
SECURE ob 56
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) 23.5 GAL S(og 'S&\ \—5’7;7‘1.“
MEDALLION SC op b
21 (2 X 16 X 5) CASE 8 GAL ggp,SO\ W00,
& ?ﬁ L\\-u}\ \ C)G\ Iv\\
HERITAGE WDG ey cb
22 9 LBS ad o
(1LB) 31 w | Z 853
PROPACONIZOLE o ‘0
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3 CASES 2V — -2
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) Bl qSZ .
24 T{{oﬂﬂﬁe 4 CASES L 2 ) <o
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 240.%¢ | 6.
BANNER MAX II < b
25 (2 X 1 GAL./ CASE) TGAL | 244 N \M4¢€.
MEGALEX
26 3-0-0 6 CASES Ny O A
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
HERITAGE FP > =
27 6 LB) 24LBs | 902 06 .

LY




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | oo UNIT PRICE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP
28 DICAMBA) 12 CASES 15 b oo
B Do\ 2X25GAL/CASE) 9.5, | 4zt
PROXY v co
29 2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) 3CASEs | |5, /< Las.
ROUND UP o "
30 47% Glyphosate 9 CASES C. — i
JBQL D (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) q\"’ cs @5‘0,
ATIA NS,
BENSUMEC 4LF - Ho -
31 2 X 1 GAL. / CASE) 1256aL | f. g\ 1230
DAC ACTION N %
32 2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 525GAL | TH. cd\ 3068
TGR b ©
33 PACLQBUTRAZOL HGAL 1 {79 < | 790,
\ Q 93 :;()’
34 ACCELYPRYN 26aL | (€55, | 3710.
. Sc‘
GAL =2 2
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) 5 203, \Y 15,
Sﬁ\
FERROMEC AC ce ol
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2 CASES 4= \3&
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) " eg ’
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-0-1 5 CASES 2’2"' El.). [ \ -3—) .]5/0-
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) S .




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | ppoiir | PRICE
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-1-4 1 CASES b oo
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) \ 76 6.~
PTO
39 5-10-5 5 GAL
)
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) \§Z .'S"—\) \(fZ §_
MOJAVE
40 IMAZYPYR 50 LBS | ]
(2 X 5 LB/ CASE) Ny B\A
£ b
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 125LBS | ] G716 =
¢ “’ -
CONDUIT WETTING AGENT . 30 §o
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) 8 GAL "Sg ‘ gc‘ Q\ 3.
S WETTING AGENT 18 F ] {2oo. =
OAR | , |
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) 16 GAL .
N
| & )
44 FREE HAND ﬁt 45 BAGS ) 3T 50
%A\‘\QN\‘}(" = Caceli&le 6 BN'C( £l 3951
TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND 4 0o
45 (50 LBS / BAG) 1500 LBS \.._ \&(00 oo
TOTAL

52,910 1S

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE



CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum

listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS:

(Amount in Figures) (Amount in Words)

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:
%4 L0 1S

(Amount in Figures) ‘
?“s%ﬂuj-ﬁht& Vhewsend Tiog EA nihed [ﬁd:j D s ’_DLIZEM%L.I‘L Leuts
(Amount in Words)

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: _ 5-5 o 05 @ (.0

Please indicate type of Bid Security: [Bid Bond [OCertified Check [Cashier’s Check

Addendum Received | 2 (If None “0”)

Signature

/A Name

DiptcOn it

~ John Deere Lanfiu 23 ompany

4385 Eact 254, S Ef
Cioveiar {d G KKJIQ Qg]]AAddress
City, State, Zip
SOO-5UN-551S Telephone

:?;ge U4g S5 5SSO Social Security Number of

Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

PRICE
PER UNIT

EXTENDED
PRICE

14

09%1§0

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% PolyS
25-2-12 (S50LBS /Ba

2Y-3-/2m §0% Polylhes | Fe

85 BAGS

Q198

1865

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% PolyS
23-2-10 (S50 LBS / BAG

80 BAGS

IR A

2/5b®

(l,ownlh;j.ﬂub AlL-0-Sm 50

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
17-3-17
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG)

22 BAGS

=D
.Efum‘s‘y

[ e et s

0G5sYY

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
25-50% Slow Release ‘N’
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG)
]2-24 -4 L (,{

102022

22-0-16
.125 DIMENSION,1% RONSTAR

\0>18

20 BAGS

D% [lyllus 20 8F Je My
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE

45 BAGS

bz-fmwmmﬂm

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
65% MU w/Micros
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG)

Wk‘s (b WD 16-0-1 e (4o Wt

(P38
_5¢BAGS

Loke S, |

7

%S4

FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG)

14-2-{42 19, A% Fr Mn

30 BAGS

Siy (401b)

3150 °°

20" Y

(07 SC

oas\ £

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN)
18% MU w/Micros
19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)

15 BAGS

rAs

575«"’5

QOWJ\%MLL&) 15-28-12 Q\l(‘. fe Fe
J




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY Pé’g“ﬁﬁT Exgggm
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) - 00 --0
? (6/5LB. CASE) 1CASE | 3S 215 %
0058 Sowr wall 65 wbe (5x W)
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE _ y
10 50% MU / UF 15 BAGS ?\é 6 i
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG) i —~
11 DEFENDOR 1PAIL | JoSp00 | [0SO DY
1X (1 GAL./2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) o
HOE9H L Defsadon. o pllew + Dinvosion 26w Susk (Beye o) - :um,ig-wé; ‘
FERTILIZER - (SPRAYABLE) .00
12 ) 1534 ~ 20 GAL “.LO 914«
2447 Cagsen Flo 18-3-( % )
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE |
13 50% SCU 125 BAGS ) ((@ 2006 «a-gc
00K L2 24-0-1) oy i thes tr? loa
FORTIFY
6-0-0 WGAL | | Lo | ISY 00
4 2X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) |
0824975 "= Sual)
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE .00 . .00
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75 GAL b(e ‘Q 7 OO . ,
KOWITE  (2.8cqal)
DISMISS .00 e
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) scaL | /49D 4550 o0
2 X .5 GAL / CASE
joosxas> (10 ek gat
00
CHLOROTHALONIL .00 0" °
. scases | [3Y &7

(2X2.5 GAL./ CASE)

054490

memz__lar_\_f_&&imiﬂ@




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY ngluclfn Ex:l:sllgm
|
INSTRATA ( Ratnc - 0D .
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) LD 12.5 GAL /’3 §°0 . /9750
3]
CcoNCERT ( PGINC . . 6P
19 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) LD BOGAL | (&0 %ZQZ |
ydsl ,
secuRe (Q&rney . 75D
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) ) BSCAL |, S 90 ) 377 5o
Y1 ’-fi(
MEDALLION sC¢ (_ Q4w —
21 (2X16X5)CASE ('\D 8GAL | SS0° | gyppy00
SZLS
HERITAGE WDG ((QLeR : _
22 | (1 LB) L’f) 9LBS |319-00 | 2¢$3 00
74140
PROPACONIZOLE
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom { 3 CASES 3 00 oD C) o0 00
i‘&b&ﬁg&sﬁf:ﬁx&? $eu ' AT < aal/t B
T - METH
24 Thiophanate 4CASES | 320 %% 4 5000
1044 /LS Le o%* 2:\:'5,(;5.Aia]“' /,,CmASEZ 2 22.50al c)
BANNER MAX 11 { Alenc ) ) L 0D
25 @ X 1 GAL./ CASE) 7 16aL |4 149%
344 (
MEGALEX _
26 3-0-0 6 CASES N O l D
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)
- HERITAGE FP (_(PG( 'JC«\D uies | /902 ‘79 20 fJ}P
(6 LB)
0¥ 217-*%




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY P{g'&% Ex:l::llz%m
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP
28 DICAMBA) 12CASES | /)4,°0° | /392 -00
044 oS T EASE L O (242 5ual/e)
PROXY 00 ), .00
29 (2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) 3CASES | /¥ 2 5Y6 ;
u4rd4q9st
ROUND UP
30 47% Glyphosate ocasEs | $§90 | ngz -
oLqe&h P‘Losu_mﬁ XS LA cal/ ec) |
BENSUMEC 4LF —on
31 (2 X 1 GAL./ CASE) 125GaL | [14-00| 1472579 ]
USHEL (1.Saak /eout)
DAC ACTION (/LW 00 -
32 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 070 52.5GAL | 74 3%&'S 2
40l Y
TGR . ~0)
3 . PACLOBUTRAZOL 10GAL | /g$700 | 1§SD
191763" Tide Paclo (1 (Aa&/ﬂaﬂ)—\
34 ACCELYPRYN CM&MCK/> 26aL  [1§6890 37) p-90
Sui4 VLN IFNE D) ,
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) SGAL | /09 Lo Sy -00
3014908 V- N i x '\m% C l-s‘aal/uu-ﬁb
FERROMEC AC _ Y T))
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2cases | 35721 70 °
0r40db  Taoo + BTSN SNV 2un (4 Swalfe)
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-0-1 5 CASES 75@ 0o 3 737)' o0
0S 73\ Qu\-nm 0(2 X25GAL./CASE) (& | &ai/tg

7




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | oo o PRICE
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-14 1cases | /)z-°P| /)z-00
059370 P (2 X 25GAL.J CASE)_ )
PTO
39 5-10-5 SGAL | \Z LD (pK“‘fO
oSty Garsin Flo ¢ sz 2 ?(';Ali\.( C?SE) T L. §aai/l 'l
MOJAVE -
40 IMAZYPYR soLes | 975 |y 750
00 DY (2 X 5 LB/ CASE)
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 125 LBS 7 §0O Q 7 3‘-60
20-%5-130S”
CONDUIT WETTING AGENT E\! < g Eg I! E 3
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) 8 GAL E _
OARS WETTING AGENT 4
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) 16 GAN O B , D
44 FREE HAND ’C,M'LU(«\D 45 BAGS Q 0" 00 | Jps-0 D
S90/1L4,
TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND L2 (, 0O #& :
45 50 LBS / BAG) 1500 LBS / o /& |
7.0 LY~ LS50
TOTAL | 422075

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum
listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS: Thirty etsht Fhowsand, Sevin hundred

j‘;g'—?‘gs ” { 7/7'”(7 ?LA"C( do//arj £ #we/vc ('(’nf‘j
(Amount in Figures) (Amount in Words)

TOTAL AMOUNT I;D
38,73 3
(Amount in Figures)

7—}’"‘4‘/ e.J«nL MOL«JGAJ/SL’V\/\ L)una//ca( 4“/@1/* 7([\!(( JQlla__é_Z&f_r_CcA_‘f;_

(Amount i Words)

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: /O

Please indicate type of Bid Security: [0Bid Bond [ICertified Check BfCashier’s Check

Addendum Received O (If None “0”)

( Zm ; 7‘&/7,,, Signature

C’"ﬂlq Fr Y an Name -

Sa /cv Reg Title
Creea Uel Ve/ Sod farmgCompany
3620 Uger Bel Jbvs ot Rehdaress
Bell 6r0<>t, OM_4s304 _ City, State, Zip

372~ g45- 250 | Telephone

32~014774b Social Security Number of
Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)

: 2015
:
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PEEIU%T‘IT Exglfll‘é‘])f‘)
FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE i gq |¢ ¢5
1 100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% PolyS 85BAGS | 30 2025
25-2-12 (S0LBS / Bag)
FERTILIZER — FAIRWAY GRADE 4, |4
2 60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% PolyS 80 BAGS |7 7/ 9 /ug ®
23-2-10 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER — TEE GRADE 7 a5 5¢
3 17-3-17 22BAGS | 30 L5/
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE 4 /5 ! 20
4 25-50% Slow Release ‘N’ 20BAGS | 32 693
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER — ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16 45 BAGS j§/2 7 123 L2 o8
5 125 DIMENSION, 1% RONSTAR
(50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE 4 3 |4 <o
6 65% MU w/Micros 50 BAGS | 33 /66§
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE £ 4
; S YD 70
7 90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros 30 BAGS Z 7 $02
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER — TEE GRADE (150 SGN) 4 a3 |4 95
8 18% MU w/Micros 15BAGS | 2§ ¢33




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | ppoiins | PRICE
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) I S
? * (6/5LB. CASE) VEASE 2917/ 1 7297°°
AL7 - ﬂ(béltomﬂe
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE . AN
10 50% MU / UF 15 BAGS {3 )6+ 2y
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
DEFENDOR
i 1X (1 GAL./ 2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) 1 PAIL b
FERTILIZER - (SPRAYABLE) 4,103 |9 _¢o
12 e 20GAL |4 ééq) 32
AT 1§-3-L 567 cw
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE ¢
13 50% SCU 125 BAGS &7 67 |I1530%
_ 255-12 (50 LBS/ BAG) 9
ALT 2 t-0 % So=e doiry I3, Fe
FORTIFY 00 .
y 6-0-0 10GAL | 76 é@/ Yo
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) ' :
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE /s
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 5GAL 23% o 1762y
ALT H«/\J[ = pl’\tlt
DISMISS iy |4 3
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3GAL |53 3¢/40
(2 X.5 GAL / CASE)
§ 6 25
CHLOROTHALONIL scases | 124 | 23

17

(2X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | tRICE | EXTEND
INSTRATA -
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 12.5 GAL b
CONCERT
19 (2X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 130 GAL WV IA
SECURE
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 23.5GAL /A
MEDALLION SC
21 (2 X 16 X 5) CASE 8 GAL P I6
HERITAGE WDG
PROPACONIZOLE
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3 CASES Jz 85')‘ § #8'6 L) 89
(2X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
T- METH 4 y,
24 Thiophanate 4 CASES | 322 or 129/ 7
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
BANNER MAX II
25 2 X 1 GAL./ CASE) 7 GAL Wik
MEGALEX I o 1w
26 3-0-0 6 CASES |15z 1350
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
HERITAGE FP 24 LES uib

27

(6 LB)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | Lo e | o pricE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP Y
28 DICAMBA) 12 CASES ﬂ’/ / 561" /367 72
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE)
PROXY g o |4
29 (2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) 3CASES | /u/f TRe
AT I %arﬂh«OV\
ROUND UP J Y
30 47% Glyphosate 9 CASES | (/1 A%y
2.5 GAL. /
T 6l ey B2 CAL CASE)
BENSUMEC 4LF ¢ _97 73
31 (2 X 1 GAL. / CASE) 125GAL | /o7 269
DAC ACTION
32 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 52.5 GAL w10
TGR 4 /TSP
33 PACLOBUTRAZOL 0GAL 79498 | /874
AT, Tide PC\CIQ
34 ACCELYPRYN 2 GAL .
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) 5 GAL .
FERROMEC AC
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2 CASES 42/ g 62 ﬂﬁé; 2Y
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE)
CYTOZORB-S d o o
37 4-0-1 5CASES | 2 275 / /137)

(2 X 2.5 GAL./CASE)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | pro s | PRICE
NITROPLAST-S 4
38 19-14 1casEs |7 ﬂ/7,o o
2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
PTO '
39 5-10-5 5 GAL J3 L3° % 25°
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)
MOJAVE Y, P o
40 IMAZYPYR 50 LBS /o33 3, /LS
(2 X 5LB/CASE) |
978 0w
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 125LBS 7 955
CONDUIT WETTING AGENT g 25
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) 8 GAL L{JSB 324
a OARS WETTING AGENT 16 GAL f]§ (3% »"6, gy 50
(Aqua Aid or similar)
! 6o _ [oX
44 FREE HAND - 45 BAGS 70 4050
TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND # o
45 (50 LBS / BAG) 1500 LBS #/ 14 1785
TOTAL |33,733/2

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE



CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum
listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS:
?55/,0 7430 , 7 Lepody oy st 37/40
(Amount in Figures) (£mdufit in Words) 4
TOTAL AMOUNT BID:

fgff 4 72. 30

(Amount in Figures)

M@M 2 /2 etz ety Lo ot elas
(Amount in Words)

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: Less Htnw 7

Please indicate type of Bid Security: Béd Bond [OCertified Check [Cashier’s Check

Addendum Received (If None “0”)
47 /4// Signature
\/P H /f Yoz Name
7?///’)‘9//4/4 //'7//14,g ¢ Title
_,ézé///// r Lec Company

Y7 Vb Address

Chrciann K, 24 202  City, State, Zip

3<T- Ble- 7775 Telephone
Q (Q - 5‘] 5082 Social Security Number of

Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

PRICE
PER UNIT

EXTENDED
PRICE

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
100% Meth Urea / UF/ 97% PolyS
25-2-12 (SOLBS / Bag)

Liebe / sactludty’

85 BAGS

2 68

A6 7R g0

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% PolyS

23-2-10 (50 LBS / BAG)
[ﬁé(/ /¢ /l(/{/

80 BAGS

A7 s0

2/6%

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
17-3-17
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG)

22 BAGS

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
25-50% Slow Release ‘N’
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG)

/0- Avo- 20

20 BAGS

.32'00

GO

FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16
125 DIMENSION,1% RONSTAR
(50 LBS / BAG)

45 BAGS

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
65% MU w/Micros
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
1B-A-(8__ (5% Mu

50 BAGS

33.0°

P50

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG)

30 BAGS

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN)
18% MU w/Micros
19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)

15 BAGS




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | peninr | prICE
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) < L
? (6/SLB. CASE) 1CASE 336 2
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
10 50% MU / UF 15BAGS | Hps
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG) 27
AS-2-F (s
DEFENDOR ¢ ¢
1 1 X (1 GAL. /2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) 1 PAIL //50 /750
FERTILIZER - (SPRAYABLE) %
12 1934 20 GAL /2. 49 240
I7-3- ¢
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE % 4
13 50% SCU 125BAGS | /¥ %O 2 350
25.5-12 (50 LBS / BAG) /
FORTIFY ) .
14 6-0-0 10 GAL A5 250
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
Label Fncivdee!
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE ; ¥
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75 GAL % R, 260
Labe| Facluded
DISMISS . ;
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3 GAL m/ 3 ¢o0
(2 X .5 GAL / CASE) e S5d
CHLOROTHALONIL scases | ¥ /75 t 975

17

(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PEI‘,)II:IUCI‘?IT Exglfl’é%m
INSTRATA c
18 @ X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 125GAL |+, 50 /778
CONCERT . s
19 2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 130 GAL | (g © g, 81>
SECURE .
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 235GAL ¢ o /3, 277. 50
MEDALLION SC . ]
2 (2 X 16 X 5) CASE 8GAL " s50 4,400
HERITAGE WDG 6 ;
22 (1LB) 9 LBS 2/7 2353
PROPACONIZOLE 4 s
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3 CASES é , 0 3(
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 1/ 94! /
T-METH .
2 Thiophanate 4CASES | 569 (| S 1ITE
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
BANNER MAX II 5
25 (2 X 1 GAL. / CASE) 7GAL | 5 214 117¢
MEGALEX _
26 3-0-0 6 CASES —
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
HERITAGE FP ¢ ¢
0
27 (6 LB) 24 LBS 702 76 0%




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | peo' e | pRICE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP
28 DICAMBA) 12CASES | % 2 158
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) /
29 PROXY 3CASES | ¢ P oo
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) Aoo
ROUND UP |
30 47% Glyphosate 9CASES | ¥ 79 # 7//
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
BENSUMEC 4LF %10
31 2 X 1 GAL. / CASE) 125GAL | 216/, |\ % /450
DAC ACTION _
32 2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) S25GAL | ¥ 7¢ ¥ 3%85
33 TGR 10 GAL 2 o0
PACLOBUTRAZOL /I [
34 ACCELYPRYN 2GAL | ¥ (8ss | T 37/0
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) S5GAL | ¥ /30 5 (50
FERROMEC AC .
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2CASES | 4, 13
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE)
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-0-1 o8 5 CASES /, 000

(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) b *H

300




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | oo e | - pptcE
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-14 1 CASES _ —
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
PTO
39 5-10-5 5 GAL _ /
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)
MOJAVE
40 IMAZYPYR 50 LBS _ —
(2 X 5LB/ CASE)
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 125LBS | 7/ ;A * 940
CONDUIT WETTING AGENT 4
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) 8 GAL 2 2 ¥ 3 01/
OARS WETTING AGENT ¢ 20 &
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) 16 GAL g 280
FlectT
4 FREE HAND - 45BAGS | 9p ‘51,/, o0
TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND
45 (50 LBS / BAG) 1500LBS | / /4 /785
TOTAL g5 672, 30

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE



CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum
listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS:

L 33 , 352, 35 E16H1) FroE  THou Sawd  THIGE Huwdesd
(Amount in Figures) (Amount in Words) FrF /- TLo AvD MNIpoT)
o s
TOTAL AMOUNT BID:

¥95,352.95

(Amount in Figures)
ERONt Pre THouswd TMREE ALwdesp (IFry -7=e  Ash__ IMrost) Rd
(Amount in Words) (o078

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: ' (_PAYS

Please indicate type of Bid Security: B‘éid Bond OCertified Check [OCashier’s Check

Addendum Received 0 (If None *“0”)

lﬁplv M« Signature
/Y "/

/404"4 bPLLo,«J Name
SALE S Title

/Z/ cLerA  CHEMEe &= Company

g00 DvSteiputpow M.  Address

Cotuwus ol 43225 City, State, Zip
5133/ 7/5’7/ Telephone
-6293085 Social Security Number of

‘ Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | pro i | PRICE
FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE [ .
1 100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% PolyS 85 BAGS 52‘"2‘5'/ ¥2,231.25
25-2-12 (SOLBS / Bag) .
20-2-11 8S°[ METH LLEA >
FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE /
2 60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% PolyS 80 BAGS |§24.00 b|qzo.00
23-2-10 (50 LBS / BAG) Bl '
25-S°IS sp/ mEN weEA
FERTILIZER — TEE GRADE
‘ O
3 17-3-17 22BAGS 2115 [ |beto.s
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG) RA G
[8-3-15 [S/ wlimaremé
FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE P .
4 25-50% Slow Release ‘N’ 20BAGS | e3¢ [ |5 530.00
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG) PG
[2-24-1o So'l Autpaléd &
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16 45 BAGS
5 .125 DIMENSION,1% RONSTAR N3 oA
(50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE .
6 65% MU w/Micros s0BAGS |Bpo.2s( |B( 3875
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG) BAL
[$-348 (S, MuTnALEs 6
FERTILIZER — GREENS GRADE
7 90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros 30 BAGS |7, 49 / #(29. 3°
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG) Bals
J4-9-14 99/ AmS
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN)
8 18% MU w/Micros 15 BAGS ys A /\_1 A

19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY Pgll:lUCl::lT Exglfl’é%m
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) o B,13 00
9 (6/5LB. CASE) 1case | 9.0 /w 2130
/7/1.0 DrIAmMTA € (Qu/\l.,t’ Pho )
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
10 50% MU / UF 15BAGS |97 .00/ F 3(0-00
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG) n G
25-5-1S S50 [ Al
DEFENDOR # 8/ o/b.00
1 1 X (1 GAL. /2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) IPAIL |4/ 0f é’/ l
CASE
FERTILIZER — (SPRAYABLE)
12 1834 0 20 GAL ﬁ,z'oo(/ # 7 ¢o.00
(otod /B3l 50/ Can .SL Fe 5
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
13 |2S-$-ll So /. festi 50% SCU 125 BAGS 5/5.75/ B403.1%
2'[.F¢ 25512 (SOLBS/BAG) BAL '
FORTIFY (7lcz2c
14 6-0-0 5-e '?/ 10 GAL 5‘?&00/ B Yoo.02
(X 25GAL./CASE) J. " 58 5! -
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE # #7 70000
IS (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75 GAL 3 (,,ioa/ !
Duanta 5671 Aareg o ool Smunny J*
DISMISS
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3gaL  |B55S "’O/ f 3,330.00
(2 X .5 GAL / CASE) BoT
CHLOROTHALONIL 5 150.00f |BG00.00
17 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) SCASES P/ 5&5 - 1




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | e | B o
INSTRATA $/59.00/ |B( 99500
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 125GAL |/ e L
CONCERT 8 70 ool | B 3%0.00
19 @2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 130 GAL Zf:’f !
SECURE Bses/ |53, 270.50
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 23.5 GAL gf, / I3,
MEDALLION SC 8 4 foo.co
50.09, ,
21 @2 X 16 X 5) CASE 8 GAL 55jal0/
22 HERITAGE WDG oLBS |B3/7.00/ |B2,g53.00
(1LB) A
PROPACONIZOLE
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3CASES |$.5¢.7 S'/ Fgst.z8
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 3el
T-METH
24 Thiophanate 4CASEs |7242. 50/ B 970 .00
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) CASG
BANNER MAX I Bl yq%.o°
2 (2 X 1 GAL./ CASE) 7GAL | Uj ‘('l”/ M
MEGALEX 2
26 3-0-0 6 CASES
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) MO N
’7 HER(I::]SE FP saLps 731709 |¥ 7 Gos-o°

B




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | poo i | - pRICE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP | .
28 | omec 952 . DICAMBA) 12CASES | /.50 / i) 3s0°
Imé (2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) CASE
5l
PROXY [3L.s O/ % 29,50
29 (2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) 3 CASES Onst 5
Quace ro  ETHE PHo !
ROUND UP NavGel fro .
30 47% Glyphosate Yy / 9 CASES & /S o/ $(o75- o®
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) ' 5o
BENSUMEC 4LF p3 .00/ |8 2.5%0
31 @ X 1 GAL. / CASE) 12.5 GAL bj‘l/ /,362.s
DAC ACTION $7U oo B 3885 ec
32 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 52.5 GAL 75‘1 \ / '
TGR 6 1ygoo/ | 81,480 00
33 PACLOBUTRAZOL 10 GAL / L’f | /
AuTins TIDE _PACL® D)
I
34 ACCELYPRYN 2GAL |#/85S '/ 43 Yoo
36
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) 5GAL 623 3-&0/ &/, 1599
52!
FERROMEC AC £rcmay ‘
36 15-0-06% FE  /5-0-¢ 2cases | ¥ 3100/ § Jo.0°
(2X25GAL/CASE) (7 Fe CASE
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-0-1 5 CASES
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) /U b MDD




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY P{:'&E" Exglfllé%m
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-1-4 1 CASES
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) QB I &
PTO 5
39 5-10-§ 5 GAL
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) /U /U &
MOJAVE
40 IMAZYPYR 50 LBS Bo. Zf/ B s/2.s°
(2 X 5 LB/ CASE) B
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 12sLBs | %3 oa/ 4 /005
LA
” CONDUIT WETTING AGENT 8GAL |B(3 o0 / & SoU.oo
(Aqua Aid or similar) '
(ove Purt o - (2o b«q} T
OARS WETTING AGENT
O.00 E Lo 0
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) 16 GAL ¥s - (/ §oo.o
v SGeroa GT S
44 FREE HAND - 45BAGS | B ?o,oa/ BYpso.oo
AL
45 TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND 1500 LBS |8 60 3/ HI 32940
(50 LBS / BAG) a6 /
Nrcklw Tar Powsn TITF
TOTAL |75,352.95

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE
% LronT Froe THeuSwoD THIEE HunDLED Frery-Twe AD

puery Fivé Cewnts




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposces to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department. mecting the specifications attached hereto tor the sum

listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS:

(Amount in Figures) - - (Amount in Words)

TOTAL AMOUNT BID:

4| 4s30

W)M’LQ:L({ %\h’p\. (A?nogn n Fxﬁzreq , m o MW
(Axr{e}»um in Words) G/Vf/d M

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: ___( DANS

Please indicate type of Bid Security: [OBid Bond OCertified Check K‘ashxer s Check

Addendum Received é (I None 0™

M—ﬁw)ﬂff\é Signature
\D/L/\ %M‘H@& Name
e Ry Mo etoe

KEED( Olzs/ /U _ﬂQM\paﬂy

G5 thhlianel } fe, L1
0ﬁ: City. State, lp

\sz?) 57( }’\L?Q 7/ Telephone
QZ: / Zﬁ_ 2:5_ ']L:Q_~_~_ Social Security Number of

Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number

L52-




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY

PRICE
PER UNIT

EXTENDED
PRICE

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% Poly-S
25-2-12 (50 LBS / Bag)

SUB - 22-0-22 100% EXPO

85 BAGS

$33.00

$2,805.00

FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE
60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% Poly-S
23-2-10 (50 LBS / Bag)
SUB - 22-0-22 100% EXPO

80 BAGS

$33.00

$2,640.00

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
17-3-17
93% NS-54 (50 LBS./ BAG)
SUB - 25-0-5 80% ALLN

22 BAGS

$18.55

$408.10

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
25-50% Slow Release ‘N’
14-28-10 (50 LBS. / BAGS)

20 BAGS

$28.75

$575.00

FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16
.125 DIMENSION, 1% RONSTAR
(50 LBS. / BAG)

45 BAGS

$55.25

$2,486.25

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
65% MU w/ MICROS
18-6-15 (50 LBS. /BAG)

50 BAGS

$29.85

$1,492.50

FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE
90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros
13-2-13 (50 LBS / Bag)

30 BAGS

NO BID

NO BID

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN)
18% MU w/MICROS
19-26-5 (50 LBS./BAG)

15 BAGS

$30.55

$458.25

o




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE EXTENDED
PER UNIT PRICE
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) 1 CASE $260.00 $260.00
9 (6/5 LB. CASE) per case
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
10 50% MU / UF 15 BAGS $24.50 $367.50
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
SUB - 24-0-16 50% MUTech
DEFENDOR 1 PAIL $1,105.00 $1,105.00
11 1 X (1 GAL./ 2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) per pail
FERTILIZER - (SPRAYABLE) 20 GAL $12.00 $240.00
12 18-34
SUB - TF 18-3-6 w/ Minors
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
13 50% SCU 125 BAGS $17.00 $2,125.00
25-5-12 (50 LBS / BAG)
SUB - 25-0-12 TG 50% PCSC U 2% Fe
FORTIFY
14 6-0-0 10 GAL $48.00 $480.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per gallon
SUB - TF Respo Fuel
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE 75 GAL $40.00 $3,000.00
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% per gal
2x 2.5 gal case
DISMISS
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3 GAL $585.00 $3,510.00
(2 X 0.5 GAL / CASE) per 1/2 gal
CHLOROTHALONIL 5 CASES $125.00 $625.00
17 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE EXTENDED
PER UNIT PRICE
INSTRATA 12.5 GAL $790.00 $1,975.00
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
CONCERT 130 GAL $380.00 $9,880.00
19 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
SECURE 23.5 GAL $1,412.50 $13,277.50
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) per 2 1/2 gal
MEDALLION SC 8 GAL $550.00 $4,400.00
21 (2 X 16 X 5) CASE per gallon
HERITAGE WDG 9LBS $317.00 $2,853.00
22 (1LB) per pound
PROPACONIZOLE
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3 CASES $300.00 $900.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
T-METH
24 Thiophanate 4 CASES $269.00 $1,076.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
BANNER MAX Il 7 GAL $214.00 $1,498.00
25 (2 X1 GAL./ CASE) per gallon
MAGALEX
26 3-0-0 6 CASES $180.00 $1,080.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
SUB - TF Carbon 21
HERITAGE FP 24 LBS $1,902.00 $7,608.00
27 (6 LB) per 6 #

ﬁ




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO

FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE EXTENDED
PER UNIT PRICE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2,4-D, MECOPROP
28 DICAMBA) 12 CASES $111.85 $1,342.20
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) per case
Triplet SF
PROXY 3 CASES $179.00 $537.00
29 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
SUB - Ethephon 2SL Select
ROUND UP
30 47% Glyphosate 9 CASES $92.00 $828.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
SUB - Razor Pro
BESUMEC 4LF 12.5 GAL $115.00 $1,437.50
31 (2 X1 GAL./ CASE) per gallon
DAC ACTION 52.5 GAL $185.00 $3,885.00
32 (2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per 21/2 gal
TGR 10 GAL $198.00 $1,980.00
33 PACLOBUTRAZOL per gallon
Tide Paclo 2SC PGR
ACELYPRYN 2 GAL $927.50 $3,710.00
34 per 1/2 gal
PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) 5 GAL $283.00 $1,415.00
35 per gallon
FERROMEC AC
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2 CASES $60.00 $120.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) per case
SUB - TF Blade Iron 15-0-0 6% Fe
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-01 5 CASES $180.00 $900.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case

SUB - TF Photo Fuel




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE EXTENDED
PER UNIT PRICE
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-14 1 CASE $77.00 $77.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per case
SUB - TF 18-3-6
PTO
39 5-10-5. 5 GAL $31.00 $155.00
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) per gallon
SUB - TF Quick Green
MOJAVE
40 IMAZYPRY 50 LBS NO BID NO BID
(2 X 5LB/CASE)
PENNCROSS BENT SEED 125 LBS $7.50 $937.50
41 per pound
CONDIUT WETTING 8 GAL $40.00 $320.00
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) per galion
2 x 2.5 gal case
OARS WETTING AGENT 16 GAL $52.00 $832.00
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) per gallon
2 x 2.5 gal case
FREEHAND 45 BAGS $90.00 $4,050.00
44 each
TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND 1500 LBS $1.20 $1,800.00
45 |(50 LBS / BAG) per pound
TOTAL $91,451.30

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE

REZ




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
BID FORM
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

The undersigned proposes to furnish FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS to the Fairfield
Parks and Recreation Department, meeting the specifications attached hereto for the sum

listed below:

TOTAL FOR CONTRACT ITEMS:

(Amount'in P'iéures) (Amount in Words)
TOTAL AMOUNT BID:
QL/ L03.57 .
(Amount in Flgures) 5 pr
(Amount in Words) Cenvis

DAYS UNTIL DELIVERY FROM DATE OF CONTRACT: 30 Days

Please indicate type of Bid Security: OBid Bond ﬁCertiﬁed Check OCashier’s Check

Addendum Received (If None “0”)

%f/ Qf% Signature

#:&EA@TM /Wv%/é( Name

Toek  Duigion ;/15(/,( Title

oinTE dlivE FCompany
818 South VS 4 Address PO, Bex /1 7

AEIOMON/ Ok ¢503¢ _ City, State, Zip
P37~ 3)3— 924K Telephone
20 "0é3 7é VX Social Security Number of

Company Owner or Federal
Identification Number




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM E
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | oo e | PRICE
-3-6
FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE 27 y 4
1 100% Meth Urea / UF / 97% PolyS 85 BAGS /7 40| | )Y77.00
25-2-12 (SOLBS / Bag) 501
SEc ATaekt
FERTILIZER - FAIRWAY GRADE 22736 4 {
2 60% Meth Urea / UF / 65% PolyS 80BAGS " )7YY_,I")3%.00
23-2-10 (50 LBS / BAG) 5
[9-3-141

FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE

3 17-3-17 22BAGS | 3.3/ . S+
93% NS-54 (50 LBS / BAG)
/¥ -38-1°
FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE ¢ ;
4 25-50% Slow Release ‘N’ 20BAGS | 0gq, 51790
14-28-10 (50 LBS / BAG) so|
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE
22-0-16
5 .125 DIMENSION,1% RONSTAR 45 BAGS N B
(50 LBS / BAG)
311
FERTILIZER - GREENS GRADE 17-3 4 f . 50
6 65% MU w/Micros S0BAGS [ 323 /p J62
18-6-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
FERTILIZER —- GREENS GRADE £ { §D
7 90% Ammonium Sulfate 3% Fe Micros 30 BAGS 22.47 5o (p(’{}
13-2-13 (50 LBS / BAG)  [3-3-13
94% AMS
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE (150 SGN) -1
8 18% MU w/Micros 15 BAGS

19-26-5 (50 LBS / BAG)

593.7% ) Ty ap




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

17

(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | pror | PRiCE
BARRICADE (PRODIAMINE) # ¢ 50
? (6/5LB. CASE) 1CASE (. 5# 2 30
FERTILIZER - TEE GRADE
10 50% MU / UF 15 BAGS N B
25-5-15 (50 LBS / BAG)
1 DEFERDOR 1 PAIL #7}7,00 é‘/‘o}? oD
1 X (1 GAL./2 GAL. DIMENSION ECW) ‘
" FERTILIZEIIQS—- 3(_S4PRAYABLE)\L e | 00AL ¢ 1.8 /,7 ° ¢337 4
1836 o't VeonTs  2¥P
FERTILIZER - ROUGH GRADE 3
13 50% SCU 125 BAGS ; )4.18 177250
25-5-12 (50 LBS / BAG) 8
¥
FORTIFY
» 6-0-0 10 GAL /\)B
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) .
KPHITE SYSTEMIC FUNGICIDE b0l 25
15 (Phosphorous Acid) 55% 75GAL "9 9aL| | 575 '
DISMISS
16 (SULFENTRAZONE) 3 GAL )\/B
(2 X .5 GAL / CASE)
THALONIL $ £ 2)
CHLORO 5CcAsEs |/ 97.68 mt (1A ©




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY ngllﬁfn EXIT lfll‘é‘;:ED
INSTRATA
18 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 12.5 GAL N B
CONCERT
19 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 130 GAL NB
SECURE
20 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 23.5 GAL /\w
MEDALLION SC N
A (2 X 16 X 5) CASE 8 GAL b
2 HERITAGE WDG ois  [1i375 49 625 00
. aiB ; 14 25,
Bioping STRdbe 50 W( I¥6#/es | 1) Lbs 9 At
PROPACONIZOLE
23 e.g. Banner, Fathom 3 CASES A/ B
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
T-METH 4 g y
24 Thiophanate 4 CASES 9 )
(2 X 2.5 GAL./ CASE) Z/ Z4 7%‘[’
BANNER MAX II
25 2 X 1 GAL. / CASE) 7GAL NB
MEGALEX
26 3-0-0 6 CASES ’\\ %
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
’; HERITAGE FP 24 LBS N B

(6 LB)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015
PRICE | EXTENDED
ITE E I
M DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | oo it | PRICE
3WAY WEED SPRAY - (2, 4-D, MECOPROP £ Y
28 DICAMBA) 12 CASES |71 149 89,40
(2X 2.5 GAL/ CASE) Rjopivy STREF Fikea ol / A&7
PROXY
29 (2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) 3 CASES N 3
ROUND UP
30 47% Glyphosate 9 CASES b ﬁ O .l $(077,05
(2X 2.5 GAL./ CASE)  [Bjpa dCoMs‘st.s
BENSUMEC 4LF
31 @ X 1 GAL. / CASE) 12.5 GAL N B
DAC ACTION
32 (2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE) 52:5 GAL /\1 3
TGR
33 PACLOBUTRAZOL 10 GAL N 3
34 ACCELYPRYN 2 GAL N B
35 PRIMO MAXX (1 GAL) 5 GAL N B
FERROMEC AC $ $
36 15-0-0 6% FE 2 CASES 8, o7 al %70
(2 X 2.5 GAL / CASE) Porlbiny Crolwap Fore
CYTOZORB-S
37 4-0-1 5 CASES N 3
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)




CITY OF FAIRFIELD, OHIO
FERTILIZER AND CHEMICALS

2015

PRICE | EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | pro it | PRICE
NITROPLAST-S
38 19-1-4 1 CASES ﬁ 3
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
PTO
39 5-10-5 5 GAL NB
(2 X 2.5 GAL. / CASE)
MOJAVE
40 IMAZYPYR 50 LBS M 5
(2 X 5 LB/ CASE)
¢ $
41 PENNCROSS BENT SEED 12siBs | /18]y G50
5% bhgs
CONDUIT WETTING AGENT
42 (Aqua Aid or similar) 8 GAL NB
OARS WETTING AGENT
43 (Aqua Aid or similar) 16 GAL N ‘3
44 FREE HAND 45 BAGS ¢ (D,ICI $3q 96,55
e oy
BN)DW? 37 /o A5
45 TURF TYPE TALL FESCUE BLEND 1500 LBS $ I | ’(ﬁ / b ¢ 17'., D.00

(50 LBS / BAG)

TOTAL

2‘//&03 )

ALL PRODUCTS LARGELY BASED ON ANDERSON COMPANY PRODUCTS FOR CROSS REFERENCE




